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Abstract

In this groundbreaking study, we sink our teeth into the mysterious interplay between Washington state 
Democrat votes for Senators and the number of hotdogs consumed by Nathan's Hot Dog Eating 
Competition champion. Leveraging a data-driven approach with datasets from MIT Election Data and 
Science Lab, Harvard Dataverse, and Wikipedia, we uncover a surprisingly strong correlation coefficient 
of 0.9058035 and a statistically significant p-value < 0.01 for the period spanning 1979 to 2018. Our 
findings not only shed light on the electoral appetites of Washington voters but also reveal a puzzling 
connection to the culinary conquests of competitive eaters. The results, though unexpected, leave us 
relishing in the statistical feast of democracy and gastronomy. It seems that when it comes to hotdogs and
Senate votes, there's more than meets the bun! As the data unraveled before us, a poignant dad joke 
emerged: "Why did the Democrat bring mustard to the voting booth? For the 'politic'." Our research 
serves as a reminder that even the most unexpected statistical associations are worth savoring. So, as 
we digest these findings, let's remain open to the whimsical twists and turns of data analysis, much like 
the unpredictable trajectory of a frankfurter launched from a condiment-laden bun.
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1. Introduction

As  the  old  adage  goes,  "Politics  and
hotdogs are not  for  the faint  of  heart,  nor

weak  of  stomach."  In  this  peculiar  and
piquant  research  endeavor,  we  delve  into
the  curious  nexus  between  the  voting
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behaviors  of  Washington  state  Democrats
and  the  champion  of  Nathan's  Hot  Dog
Eating  Competition.  For  years,  these
seemingly  disparate  domains  have
tantalized  the  scientific  community,
beckoning  us  to  unravel  the  enigmatic
relationship that binds them together.

Amidst the labyrinth of state elections and
the harrowing heat  of  competitive hot  dog
consumption, our study seeks to add a dash
of relish to the field of both political science
and  gastronomic  statistics.  By  examining
the  electoral  data  from  the  MIT  Election
Data  and  Science  Lab  and  the  hotdog
consumption  figures  from  the  annals  of
Nathan's  Famous  annual  contest,  we  set
out  to  unearth  the  statistical  meat  of  this
matter.

As  we embarked  on this  journey,  a  fitting
dad  joke  came  to  mind:  "Why  did  the
statistician bring a toothpick to the hotdog
eating  contest?  He  wanted  to  skewer  the
data!"  Indeed,  our  quest  to  uncover  the
whims of statistical fate has led us to some
unexpected,  yet  undeniably  delicious,
conclusions.

The  correlation  coefficient  between
Democrat votes for Senators in Washington
and  the number  of  hotdogs consumed by
the  Nathan's  Hot  Dog  Eating  Competition
champion revealed itself to be a compelling
0.9058035. With a p-value of less than 0.01,
the statistical appetite for significance in our
findings  proved  to  be  insatiable.  This
linkage,  though  initially  hard  to  swallow,
invites  us  to  reconsider  the  tantalizing
connections  that  exist  within  the  realm  of
electoral and epicurean indulgence.

In the spirit of whimsy and wonderment, our
analysis allows us to savor the rich flavors
of  statistical  inquiry  and  the  unexpected
synergies  that  arise  when  the  savory
goodness  of  political  participation
encounters  the  mustard-laden  fervor  of
competitive  eating.  It  seems  that  when  it
comes  to  unraveling  the  mysteries  of

democracy and frankfurters, the task is not
just  reserved  for  the  "brave,"  but  perhaps
the "bratwurst" among us.

In  the  next  section,  we  will  dive  into  the
methodology that allowed us to take a big
"bite"  out  of  this  perplexing intersection  of
data.

2. Literature Review

The  enigmatic  relationship  between
Washington  state  Democrat  votes  for
Senators and the consumption of  hotdogs
by the Nathan's Hot Dog Eating Competition
champion has long puzzled researchers and
gastronomers  alike.  In  "The  Statistical
Sizzle:  Examining  the  Political  Palate,"
Smith  and  Doe  conduct  a  comprehensive
analysis of voting statistics and competitive
eating  phenomena,  ultimately  raising
questions  about  the  unexpected
connections between civic engagement and
culinary prowess. Similarly, Jones in "On the
Trail  of  Tasty  Politics"  delves  into  the
historical  nuances  of  state  elections  and
their  potential  impact  on  the  gustatory
achievements of competitive eaters.

While  these  studies  provide  a  solid
foundation for  our investigation,  it  became
evident  that  a more holistic  approach was
needed  to  fully  digest  the  complexities  of
this curious correlation. Thus, we turned to
non-fiction works such as "Hot Dog History:
A Condimental  Perspective"  and  "Election
Fever: The Political  Appetite," in search of
historical  context  and  culinary  wisdom.
These sources,  despite their  serious tone,
allowed us to relish the depth of knowledge
available  on  the  subject,  serving  as  a
reminder  that  even  the  most  somber  of
topics can benefit from a little mustard and
merriment.

In  addition to these scholarly  pursuits,  we
sought  insight  from  the  world  of  fiction,
exploring works like "The Bun Also Rises"
and  "Legislative  Sausage:  A  Novel  of
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Political  Appetites."  Although  these  literary
escapades  veered  into  the  realm  of
imagination,  they  offered  valuable
perspectives  on the intersection  of  politics
and gastronomy, reminding us that there is
often more to a statistical relationship than
meets the bun.

As we ventured deeper  into our research,
we found ourselves uncovering unexpected
inspiration from unlikely  sources.  Cartoons
such as "Scooby-Doo" and children's shows
like "Sesame Street" provided light-hearted
commentary on civic  engagement  and the
joy of culinary indulgence. Just as Scooby
and  the  gang  always  unmask  the  hidden
truth,  we  aimed  to  uncover  the  statistical
mysteries  behind  this  peculiar  pairing  of
political agency and hotdog feasts.

Embracing  the  spirit  of  whimsy  and
scholarly  tenacity,  our  literature  review
journeyed through the serious, the fictional,
and the delightfully unexpected, serving as
a  testament  to  the  delightful  complexities
that  await  those  brave  enough  to  explore
the  statistical  buffet  of  democracy  and
dachshunds.  As  we  consider  the
intersection of Washington Senatorial votes
and  Nathan's  hotdog  triumphs,  we  are
reminded of a timeless dad joke: "Why don't
hotdogs make good politicians? They simply
can't  ketchup  to  the  issues!"  In  the  same
vein,  our  endeavor  embodies  the  joyous
pursuit  of  uncovering  statistical  truths
amidst  the  mustard-covered  delights  of
empirical inquiry.

3. Our approach & methods

To  sink  our  teeth  into  the  tantalizing
correlation  between  Democrat  votes  for
Senators  in  Washington  state  and  the
astonishing feats of hot dog consumption at
Nathan's  Hot  Dog Eating Competition,  our
research team employed a blend of  zesty
statistical  methods  and  a  dash  of
unconventional data collection.

First,  we  meticulously  sourced  electoral
data  from  the  MIT  Election  Data  and
Science Lab, capturing the voting appetites
of  Washingtonians  over  an  exhaustive
period  from 1979  to  2018.  This  extensive
temporal  range  allowed  us  to  track  the
electorate's shifting gustatory preferences in
response to the political menu on offer. It's
safe to say that our data had all the "relish-
able" qualities needed to make meaningful
inferences.

Once we had devoured the electoral data,
we turned our attention to the titillating world
of  competitive  eating,  diving  into  the
historical  archive  of  Nathan's  Famous
annual contest.  This quirky dataset served
as the condiment to our statistical  hotdog,
offering insight into the colossal quantities of
franks  consumed  by  the  reigning
champions. Our data collection process was
so  thorough,  we  even  uncovered  a  rare
photograph of a hotdog yelling "relish me!" It
seems  our  search  was  truly  "papaya-ing"
off!

In amalgamating these diverse datasets, we
adopted a rigorous approach to harmonize
the disparate flavors of political voting and
competitive  eating.  Utilizing  advanced
statistical  software  with  a  pinch  of
algorithmic  prowess,  we  aptly  weaved  a
statistical  tablecloth  upon  which  to  feast
upon  our  data.  Our  approach  was  as
meticulous as it was mirthful, reminding us
of  yet  another  dad  joke:  "Why  was  the
statistician  unimpressed  with  the  hotdog
data? It was too 'frank'."

Navigating  the  landscape  of  data
integration,  we  encountered  some
unexpected  hurdles  –  akin  to  finding  a
pickle in a haystack. There were moments
when our data analysis felt like a precarious
juggling  act,  attempting  to  balance  the
weight  of  electoral  shifts  with  the  sheer
enormity of hotdog consumption. Yet, like a
ketchup  stain  on  a  white  lab  coat,  our
methodology  remained  resilient,  steadfast,
and undeniably flavorful.
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Once  our  datasets  had  been  gently
simmered,  boiled,  and  grilled  to  statistical
perfection,  we  performed  a  rigorous
correlation analysis. With bated breath and
a  hearty  appetite  for  discovery,  we
uncovered  a  striking  correlation  coefficient
of  0.9058035.  This  finding  left  us  both
astounded  and  oddly  craving  for  ballpark
franks  –  a  testament  to  the  power  of
unexpected statistical revelations.

Additionally, our hypothesis testing yielded a
p-value  of  less  than  0.01,  solidifying  the
robustness  of  our  findings.  This  statistical
verdict was met with both uproarious cheers
and a palpable hunger for rigorous scientific
inquiry. It appears that our study's statistical
results  were  truly  the  mustard  on  the
research hotdog – a pleasant surprise that
left our taste buds tingling.

In the upcoming section, we will present the
delectable  findings  from  our  analysis,
delving  into  the  implications  and  potential
avenues  for  future  research.  But  for  now,
let's  savor  the  statistical  buffet  that  our
methodology  has  laid  out  before  us  –
remember, in the world of research, there's
always room for "dessert-ations"!

4. Results

The  analysis  of  our  data  revealed  a
remarkably  strong  association  between
Democrat votes for Senators in Washington
and  the number  of  hotdogs consumed by
the  Nathan's  Hot  Dog  Eating  Competition
champion.  The  correlation  coefficient  of
0.9058035  suggests  a  nearly  perfect
positive  linear  relationship  between  these
seemingly  unrelated  variables.  It's  as  if
these  numbers  were  in  perfect  "ketchup"
with each other!

Throughout the 40-year period from 1979 to
2018,  our  findings  consistently  indicated
that  as  the  Democrat  votes  for  Senators
increased,  so  did  the  number  of  hotdogs
devoured  by  the  Nathan's  champion.  This

connection  between  political  preferences
and  competitive  eating  performances  is
indeed an unexpected "wiener" in the world
of statistical analysis.

Our  analysis  also  yielded  an  r-squared
value  of  0.8204799,  indicating  that  over
82%  of  the  variability  in  the  hotdog
consumption  by  the  champion  can  be
explained  by  the  Democrat  votes  for
Senators in Washington. It's as if the voters'
decisions  were  directly  fueling  the
competitive  eater's  appetite,  akin  to  a
"constitutional"  dependency  on  hotdog
intake!

Figure 1. Scatterplot of the variables by year

Furthermore, the p-value of less than 0.01
further  solidifies  the  statistical  significance
of this connection. It's safe to say that the
link  between  political  leanings and hotdog
consumption  is  not  just  a  random  "relish"
but a tangible trend worth sinking our teeth
into!

We  also  created  a  scatterplot  (Fig.  1)  to
visually  capture  this  strong  positive
relationship between the two variables. The
plot  succinctly  illustrates  the  upward
trajectory  of  hotdog  consumption  as
Democrat votes for Senators in Washington
increase.  It's  like  a  "frank"  explanation  in
picture form!

In  summary,  our  research  unearths  a
compelling and inexplicable bond between
the political decisions of Washington voters
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and the indulgences of competitive eaters.
As we digest these findings, let's remember
that  in  the  world  of  statistics,  even  the
quirkiest  connections  can  pack  a  flavorful
punch.

5. Discussion

The results of our study provide compelling
evidence  for  a  strong  and  statistically
significant  relationship  between  Democrat
votes for  Senators in  Washington and the
number  of  hotdogs  consumed  by  the
Nathan's  Hot  Dog  Eating  Competition
champion.  This  unexpected  link,  with  a
correlation coefficient of 0.9058035 and a p-
value  of  less  than  0.01,  defies  traditional
expectations and invites a plethora of puns
and  jests  to  accompany  our  serious
scholarly discourse.

Building on the works of Smith and Doe, as
well  as  Jones,  our  findings  support  the
notion  that  political  appetites  may  extend
beyond the ballot box and into the world of
competitive eating. As we sink our teeth into
this correlation, it becomes evident that the
whimsical  relationship  between  electoral
preferences and gastronomic achievements
is  not  just  a  "bunch  of  bologna"  but  a
legitimate  area  of  inquiry  deserving  of
further exploration.

As  we  consider  the  implications  of  this
connection, one is reminded of the classic
dad joke: "What did the statistician say after
dining at  the hotdog stand? 'I  relished it!'"
Indeed, our findings are not just a statistical
feast  but  a  reminder  that  even  the  most
unexpected ties can offer valuable insights
into  the  idiosyncrasies  of  human behavior
and societal trends.

The  r-squared  value  of  0.8204799
underscores the substantial extent to which
Democrat votes for Senators in Washington
can  explain  the  variability  in  the  hotdog
consumption by the champion. It’s as if the
voters'  decisions  were  seasoning  the

competitive  eater's  performances,  adding
an extra "dash" of statistical intrigue to the
conventional  wisdom surrounding  electoral
outcomes.

Moreover,  our  scatterplot  visually
encapsulates  the  upward  trajectory  of
hotdog consumption as Democrat votes for
Senators in Washington increase, akin to a
comical  yet  revelatory  snapshot  of  this
peculiar  relationship.  It’s  as  if  each  data
point  on  the  plot  tells  a  charming  tale  of
political  fervor  fueling  the  yearning  for  a
good ol'  hotdog.  One might  even say that
it's  a  "wiener"  in  terms  of  capturing  the
essence of this curious statistical alignment.

In  summary,  our  research  unearths  an
unexpected  yet  robust  bond  between  the
political sway of Washington voters and the
gustatory feats of  competitive  eaters.  This
unusual correlation, much like a well-crafted
dad  joke,  transcends  the  conventional
boundaries of  statistical  inquiry,  leaving us
with  a  lingering  sense  of  wonder  and
amusement  in  the  face  of  empirical
revelations.

6. Conclusion

In conclusion, like a perfectly grilled hot dog
tucked  into  a  soft  bun,  our  research  has
uncovered a surprisingly robust relationship
between  Democrat  votes  for  Senators  in
Washington  and  the  number  of  hotdogs
consumed by the Nathan's Hot Dog Eating
Competition champion. It's as if  their fates
were "bunned" to intertwine! These findings
serve  as  a  vivid  reminder  that  statistical
analysis  can  sometimes  lead  us  down
unexpected yet tantalizing paths, much like
finding a pickle in a pile of potato salad.

Our study not only adds a quirky twist to the
annals of political and gastronomic research
but also showcases the dynamic and often
whimsical nature of statistical inquiry. It's a
delicious reminder that even in the serious
world of academia, a sprinkle of humor can
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add some much-needed flavor to the mix.
As the old saying goes, "A good statistician
can make anything taste like a hot dog, and
a good joke can make any research paper a
hit at the academic grill-out."

Therefore,  with  a sense of  fullness  in  our
hearts and perhaps a bit of indigestion from
all  the  data  crunching,  we  assert  that  no
further  research is  needed  in  this  area.  It
seems  that  the  appetite  of  Washington
voters indeed bears a curious influence on
the champion of hot dog consumption. It's a
statistical  bellyful  that  we  can  all  savor
without reservation.
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