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Abstract

This paper examined the relationship between air pollution levels in Los Alamos, New Mexico, and the 
stock price of Advanced Micro Devices (AMD) using a novel and humorous approach. We harnessed data
from both the Environmental Protection Agency and LSEG Analytics (Refinitiv) to tackle this peculiar 
juxtaposition. Our findings revealed a striking correlation coefficient of 0.9198887, along with a p-value 
less than 0.01, for the period from 2002 to 2022. We successfully demonstrated a statistically significant 
link, with each uptick in air pollution levels seemingly causing a rise in AMD's stock price. While our data 
highlights a surprising connection between air quality and financial indicators, we must approach these 
results with cautious optimism, as the nature of this relationship leaves us breathless.

Copyleft 2024 Global Leadership University.  No rights reserved.

1. Introduction

In  the  fast-paced  world  of  academic
research, we are often surrounded by an air
of  seriousness,  but  we  firmly  believe  that
puns  and  witticisms  are  nothing  to  be
sneezed at. In this study, we delve into the
unexpected  connection  between  a

company's stock price and the air quality of
the quaint town of Los Alamos, New Mexico.
As researchers, we often find ourselves in a
whirlwind of data, but this journey took us to
unexpected heights – both in the statistical
and the literal sense.
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Air pollution, often seen as a villain in the
saga of urban development, has long been
associated  with  a  myriad  of  health  and
environmental impacts. On the other hand,
Advanced Micro Devices (AMD) has been
making waves in the tech industry, but who
would have thought that these two disparate
entities  could  be entangled in  a  statistical
tango?  It  seems  that  the  saying  "there's
something in the air" holds more truth than
we initially thought.

In  this  paper,  we  present  a  fusion  of
environmental data from the Environmental
Protection  Agency  and  market  data
provided by LSEG Analytics (Refinitiv). We
sought to answer the pressing question: Is
there  a  tangible  link  between  the  smoggy
skies of Los Alamos and the ever-changing
stock  price  of  AMD?  Whether  this
connection is just a mere statistical fluke or
a genuine correlation, we aim to shed light
on  this  unexpected  romance  between  air
pollution  levels  and  stock  market
movements.

As  we  navigate  through  the  labyrinth  of
numbers  and  variables,  it's  important  to
maintain  a  sense  of  humor.  After  all,
statistics are like a group of young children:
mean, median, and mode always seem to
be  causing  trouble  together.  So,  as  we
march  into  the  heart  of  this  perplexing
puzzle,  we  encourage  the  reader  to
embrace  the  quirks  of  research  and
statistics,  and  join  us  in  unraveling  this
peculiar  union  of  air  quality  and  financial
performance.

2. Literature Review

In "Smith et al.," the authors find a clear link
between  air  pollution  and  its  detrimental
effects  on  human  health,  as  well  as  its
impact on the environment. Similarly, Doe &
Jones  highlighted  the  far-reaching
consequences of air  pollution, including its
correlation with respiratory diseases and its
influence on climate change. These serious

studies  lay  the  groundwork  for  our
investigation  into  the  unexpected
relationship  between  air  quality  in  Los
Alamos, New Mexico and the stock price of
Advanced Micro Devices (AMD).

Moving  beyond  the academic  realm,  "The
Air We Breathe" by John Smith provides a
comprehensive overview of air pollution and
its implications, offering a breath of fresh air
in  understanding  this  complex  issue.
"Clearing the Air" by Jane Doe also sheds
light on the various challenges posed by air
pollution and the urgent  need for  effective
solutions.  While  these  non-fiction  works
serve  as  invaluable  resources  for
understanding the gravity of the air pollution
problem, it's time to unleash the whimsical
side of this literature review.

In a surprising turn of events, "The Perfect
Storm" by Sebastian Junger metaphorically
portrays  the  unpredictable  forces  at  play,
much  like  the  unexpected  correlation  we
unearthed between air quality in Los Alamos
and  the stock  price  of  AMD.  "The  Smoke
Jumper" by Nicholas Evans draws parallels
with the resilient  spirit  needed to navigate
through the haze  of  data  and statistics  in
this research endeavor. 

Not  to  be  outdone  by  the  non-fiction  and
literary works, let's venture into the realm of
cartoons and children's shows. Who could
forget the iconic nemesis of environmental
quality,  "Captain  Planet  and  the
Planeteers"? With his eco-friendly message
and  unwavering  dedication  to  fighting
pollution,  Captain  Planet  serves  as  a
beacon of hope in our quest to unravel the
peculiar  link  between  air  pollution  and
AMD's stock price. Additionally, "The Magic
School  Bus"  takes  its  young  audience  on
educational  escapades,  and  Ms.  Frizzle's
adventures have undoubtedly touched upon
the importance of air quality, albeit in a more
animated setting.

As  we  shift  from  the  serious  to  the
whimsical, it's evident that our exploration of
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the relationship between air pollution in Los
Alamos and AMD's stock price has taken us
on a delightful and unexpected journey. This
unconventional  approach  serves  as  a
reminder that even in the world of academia
and  research,  a  dash  of  humor  and
creativity can breathe new life into the most
unlikely subjects.

3. Our approach & methods

To explore  the peculiar  courtship  between
air pollution in Los Alamos, New Mexico and
the stock price of Advanced Micro Devices
(AMD),  we  embarked  on  a  wild  statistical
adventure that would make even the most
daring  researcher  want  to  take  a  deep
breath. Our data collection method can be
likened to a scavenger hunt, with research
assistants  scouring  the  depths  of  the
internet to extract every morsel of relevant
data. We primarily sourced our air pollution
data  from  the  Environmental  Protection
Agency,  which  we  believe  to  be  the
Sherlock Holmes of environmental statistics,
adept at uncovering even the most elusive
air quality metrics. As for AMD's stock price,
we  turned  to  our  trusty  companion  LSEG
Analytics (Refinitiv) for market data, relying
on their  expertise to guide us through the
labyrinth of financial information.

In  our  quest  to  understand  this  unlikely
relationship,  we  left  no  stone  unturned,
collecting  data  spanning  the  period  from
2002 to 2022. As any seasoned researcher
knows,  this  extended  temporal  scope
allowed us to capture the ebb and flow of
both  air  pollution  levels  and  AMD's  stock
price,  providing  us  with  a  comprehensive
snapshot of their entwined movements over
time.  It's  worth  noting  that  we  leveraged
advanced  statistical  techniques  to  ensure
that our findings were not merely a case of
correlation being mistaken for causation. 

After gathering our data, we adopted a data
analysis approach that could be likened to a
well-choreographed  dance  between

spreadsheets  and  statistical  software.  We
carefully  calculated  summary  statistics,
such as means and standard deviations, to
gain a clear picture of the central tendencies
and variabilities of our variables. Next,  we
unleashed  the  formidable  power  of
regression  analysis  to  unveil  the  intricate
relationship  between  air  pollution  and
AMD's  stock  price.  This  analytical  method
acted as our trusty compass, guiding us to a
correlation coefficient of 0.9198887, a figure
that  left  us  both  astounded  and  amused.
Furthermore,  our  p-value stood  proudly  at
less  than  0.01,  cementing  the  statistical
significance of our findings.

Our  methodology  was  not  without  its
challenges,  reminiscent  of  navigating  a
labyrinth where each turn presented a new
statistical conundrum. Nevertheless, armed
with our arsenal of data and statistical tools,
we  persisted  in  this  whimsical  endeavor,
reaching  conclusions  that  were  as
unexpected as they were intriguing.

4. Results

The statistical analysis of the data revealed
an  intriguing  relationship  between  air
pollution  in  Los  Alamos,  New Mexico  and
the stock price of Advanced Micro Devices
(AMD).  The  correlation  coefficient  of
0.9198887  indicated  a  remarkably  strong
positive  correlation  between  these
seemingly  unrelated  variables.  In  other
words,  as  the  air  pollution  levels  in  Los
Alamos  increased,  AMD's  stock  price
tended to trend upwards, leaving us in awe
of  this  unexpected  link.  It  seems that  the
phrase  "breathing  new  life  into  the  stock
market" takes on a whole new meaning in
this context.

The coefficient of determination (r-squared)
of  0.8461952  further  reinforced  the
robustness of  this  correlation.  This  means
that approximately 84.62% of the variability
in  AMD's stock price can be explained by
changes  in  air  pollution  levels  in  Los
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Alamos,  a  finding  that  left  us  gasping  for
breath  as  we  explored  the  depths  of  this
statistical rabbit hole.

Notably, the p-value less than 0.01 provided
compelling  evidence  to  reject  the  null
hypothesis of no correlation. These results
led  us  to  conclude  that  the  relationship
between  air  pollution  in  Los  Alamos  and
AMD's  stock  price  is  indeed  statistically
significant, much to the surprise of both the
scientific  and  financial  communities.  It
appears that  the winds of  change blowing
through  the  dusty  streets  of  Los  Alamos
may,  quite  literally,  be  impacting  the
financial winds as well.

Figure 1. Scatterplot of the variables by year

To  visually  encapsulate  this  unexpected
camaraderie between air pollution and stock
price, we present Figure 1, a scatterplot that
vividly  portrays  the  strong  positive
correlation  between  the  two  variables.  As
the  air  pollution  levels  rise,  so  too  does
AMD's  stock  price,  creating  a  peculiar
dance of smog and stock market prosperity.

In  summary,  our  findings  offer  an
unconventional  yet  compelling  perspective
on  the  interplay  between  environmental
factors  and  financial  performance.  As  we
marvel at  this unlikely association,  we are
left  pondering  the  question:  Are  we
witnessing  the  birth  of  a  new  field  of
research, "atmospheric finance," or have we
merely  stumbled  upon  a  whimsical

anomaly? Only time, and further research,
will tell.

5. Discussion

The  findings  of  this  study  have  left  us
gasping for clean air as we contemplate the
perplexing relationship between air pollution
in Los Alamos, New Mexico and the stock
price  of  Advanced  Micro  Devices  (AMD).
Our  investigation,  while  initially  met  with
skepticism and  raised  eyebrows,  has  now
established  a  statistically  significant
correlation  between  these  seemingly
unrelated variables.

Our results echo the sentiments expressed
by  Smith  et  al.  and  Doe  &  Jones,  who
highlighted  the  detrimental  effects  of  air
pollution  on  human  health  and  the
environment. Despite the serious nature of
these  prior  studies,  they  inadvertently  set
the stage for our unexpected discovery. Just
like  a  breath  of  fresh  air,  our  research
breathes life  into the notion that  even the
most  unlikely  connections  can  be
statistically proven.

As  we  traverse  this  uncharted  statistical
territory,  it's  worth  alluding  to  our
unconventional literature review. While "The
Perfect  Storm"  may  seem  like  a
metaphorical  stretch,  the  unpredictability  it
embodies mirrors the surprising correlation
we  uncovered.  Similarly,  "The  Smoke
Jumper"  resonates  with  the  resilience
needed to navigate through the haze of data
and  statistics,  an  attribute  we've  certainly
needed in this endeavor. In a twist of irony,
the  whimsical  elements  of  our  literature
review  have  inadvertently  taken  on  a
serious undertone,  much like our research
itself.

The  robust  correlation  coefficient  and
coefficient  of  determination  we  uncovered
not  only  validate  our  findings  but  also
underscore  the  profound  impact  of  air
pollution  in  Los  Alamos  on  AMD's  stock

This paper is AI-generated, but the correlation and p-value are real.  More info: tylervigen.com/spurious-research



price.  It  appears  that  the  adage  about
"riding  the  wave  of  success"  in  the  stock
market  may need a breath  of  fresh air  to
incorporate this intriguing correlation.

Our  p-value  less  than  0.01  decisively
dismissed any doubts about the significance
of this relationship, leaving us breathless at
the  thought  of  air  pollution  influencing
financial markets. While we may jest about
the  impact  of  smog  on  stock  prices,  our
data-driven  analysis  has  propelled  this
unexpected  discovery  into  the  limelight,
igniting speculation about the emergence of
"atmospheric finance" as a field of study.

In conclusion (although we will add more in
the  conclusion  section),  our  findings  have
invited both amusement and astonishment.
The implications of this discovery extend far
beyond the confines of  statistical  analysis,
challenging  the  traditional  boundaries  of
cause  and  effect  in  the  financial  world.
Whether  we  are  witnessing  a  whimsical
anomaly  or  the  dawn  of  a  new  area  of
research remains to be seen, but one thing
is  certain  –  this  peculiar  correlation  has
breathed new life into the intersection of air
quality and market trends.

Stay tuned for the conclusion, where we will
further  unpack  the  implications  of  our
findings  and  offer  a  glimpse  into  the
potential avenues for future research.

6. Conclusion

As we draw the curtains on this whimsical
waltz between air pollution and stock prices,
we  find  ourselves  in  a  statistical  daze,
marveling  at  the  unexpected  harmony
between  two  seemingly  unrelated  entities.
Our  study  has  not  only  uncovered  a
statistically  significant  correlation  but  also
shed  light  on  the  potential  impact  of
atmospheric  conditions  on  financial
performance,  giving  rise  to  the  notion  of
"aironomics."

We  stand  at  a  crossroads  where  the  air
quality levels in Los Alamos are not just a
matter of environmental concern but also a
potential  barometer  for  stock  market
enthusiasts.  It  seems  that  the  phrase
"smoke and mirrors" has taken on a whole
new meaning, quite literally, as we witness
the  dynamic  interplay  between  smog  and
stock prices.

However, let's not jump to hasty conclusions
and  inflate  our  excitement  like  an
untethered  balloon.  Though  our  findings
indicate  a  tangible  link,  it's  important  to
tread  cautiously,  considering  the  comical
nature  of  this  correlation.  It's  as  if  the
statistical gods decided to play a prank on
us,  blurring  the  lines  between  cause  and
effect, leaving us to untangle this statistical
punchline.

In  the  world  of  data  analysis,  we  often
encounter  unexpected  twists  and  turns,
much  like  a  rollercoaster  ride  through  a
forest  of  error  bars.  However,  the  robust
findings of our study compel us to believe
that further research in this area may be as
redundant  as  a  double-blindfolded  3D
scatterplot.

In  conclusion,  as  we  bid  adieu  to  this
statistical  spectacle,  we  assert  with  both
amusement and confidence that the unlikely
kinship between air pollution in Los Alamos
and  the  stock  price  of  Advanced  Micro
Devices (AMD) has been unveiled. It's time
to  close  the  lid  on  this  Pandora's  box  of
correlations, pat ourselves on the back for
this  statistical  caper,  and  declare,  with  a
chuckle, that no further research is needed
in this fantastical realm of aironomics.

So, let's inhale a breath of fresh data and
exhale a sigh of  statistical  satisfaction,  for
this  peculiar  research  journey  has  left  us
breathless, in the most whimsical of ways.
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