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Abstract

This  paper  empirically  investigates  the  intriguing  and
possibly overlooked link between annual US household
spending on housing and the stock price of CME Group
(CME).  Utilizing  comprehensive  data  sourced  from the
Bureau  of  Labor  Statistics  and  LSEG  Analytics
(Refinitiv) spanning the time period from 2003 to 2022,
we aimed to elucidate the potential  correlation between
these  two  seemingly  disparate  economic  indicators.
Employing  rigorous  statistical  analysis,  our  findings
unearthed a remarkably strong correlation coefficient  of
0.9340040, coupled with a significance level of p < 0.01.
Our  research  offers  deeper  insights  into  the  interplay
between  housing  expenditures  and  CME Group's  stock
price,  shedding light  on the  complex  web of  economic
determinants that sway market dynamics. Moreover, the
implications of  our discoveries  extend  beyond numbers
and  graphs,  delving  into  the  very  fabric  of  household
behaviors  and  financial  markets.  As  the  saying  goes,
"Where  there's  a  roof,  there's  a  trading  floor,"  and  our
research endeavors to untangle this intricate connection in
the economic landscape.

1. Introduction

In  the  realm  of  economic  analysis,  uncovering
unexpected  correlations  between  seemingly
unrelated variables  often elicits  both  curiosity  and
skepticism. Yet, as researchers, it is our duty to delve
into  the  depths  of  statistical  relationships  and
unearth  the  hidden  connections  that  govern  the
intricacies  of  market  behavior.  While  many
economic  studies  focus  on  traditional  indicators,
such  as  unemployment  rates,  GDP  growth,  or
interest  rates,  our  investigation  takes  a  more
unconventional  path,  venturing  into  the  world  of
annual US household spending on housing and the
stock price of CME Group (CME).

The  concept  of  a  relationship  between  housing
expenditures and stock prices might at first  glance
seem like comparing apples to oranges. However, as
we embark on this journey of data exploration and
analysis, we invite you to suspend disbelief and join
us in uncovering the fascinating interplay between
these two economic drivers.

Our study utilizes a comprehensive dataset sourced
from  the  Bureau  of  Labor  Statistics  and  LSEG
Analytics (Refinitiv)  spanning nearly two decades,
from 2003 to 2022. This extensive time span allows
us to capture the subtleties and fluctuations in both
household spending on housing and CME Group's
stock price,  providing a  robust  foundation  for  our
investigation.  As  we  applied  rigorous  statistical
methods  to  unravel  the  potential  correlation,  the

This paper is AI-generated, but the correlation and p-value are real.  More info: tylervigen.com/spurious-research



results  that  emerged  were  nothing  short  of
remarkable.

The  correlation  coefficient  that  emerged  from our
analysis  is  a  staggering  0.9340040,  signaling  a
striking  relationship  between  US  household
spending on housing and CME Group's stock price.
It's as if these variables were engaged in a tango of
economic influence,  each  swaying in  tandem with
the other's movements. And with a significance level
of  p  <  0.01,  the  statistical  evidence  solidifies  the
legitimacy  of  this  association,  rendering  it  not  a
mere  quirk  of  data,  but  a  veritable  economic
phenomenon.

As we unravel the numbers and charts, it becomes
evident that this correlation offers a window into the
intricate  web  of  economic  determinants  that  sway
market dynamics. We move beyond the cold,  hard
figures  and  venture  into  the  realm  of  human
behavior,  illuminating  the  financial  decisions  that
underpin market movements. After all, behind every
fluctuation  in  stock  prices  lies  a  household
contemplating their  housing expenses,  intertwining
the personal and the economic on a single strand of
financial DNA.

So, as we immerse ourselves in the findings of this
study, let us keep in mind the age-old adage, "Where
there's  a  roof,  there's  a  trading floor."  This  adage,
once merely a quip, now takes on a deeper resonance
as  we  uncover  the  intricacies  of  the  relationship
between  US  household  spending  on  housing  and
CME Group's stock price. Together, let us peel back
the  layers  of  economic  analysis  and  unearth  the
surprising connections that enrich our understanding
of the world of finance.

2. Literature Review

Previous studies have examined the intricate web of
economic  indicators  and  their  impact  on  market
dynamics.  Smith  et  al.  (2017)  delved  into  the
relationship between consumer spending and stock
prices, shedding light on the behaviors of individual
investors  and  their  influence  on  market  trends.
Similarly,  Doe  and  Jones  (2019)  explored  the
psychological  factors  that  underpin  stock  price
fluctuations,  highlighting  the  intricate  dance
between market sentiment and economic data. While

these  studies  provide  valuable  insights  into  the
various  determinants  of  stock  prices,  they  do  not
specifically address the curious connection between
annual US household spending on housing and the
stock price of CME Group (CME).

Moving beyond the  realm of  traditional  economic
analysis,  our  investigation  ventures  into  uncharted
territory,  drawing  parallels  between  spending  on
housing  and the  stock  price  of  CME Group.  This
unconventional approach prompts us to consider the
broader  implications of household expenditures  on
the  financial  markets,  bridging  the  seemingly
disparate  worlds  of  personal  finances  and  stock
trading.

In "Home Economics" by Smith (2015), the author
explores the impact of housing costs on household
budgets,  offering  a  nuanced  perspective  on  the
interplay  between  housing  expenditures  and
financial decision-making. Additionally, Jones et al.
(2018)  examine  the  psychological  constructs  that
shape consumer spending habits, providing valuable
insights  into  the  underlying  drivers  of  household
financial behavior.

Transitioning  from  non-fiction  to  fiction,  "The
House of Cards" by Doe (2013) presents a riveting
tale of intrigue and power struggles in the world of
high-stakes finance, offering a dramatic portrayal of
the  forces  at  play  behind  stock  price  movements.
Similarly,  "Mortgages  and  Mischief"  by  Brown
(2016)  weaves  a  captivating  narrative  of  financial
intrigue and housing-related shenanigans, offering a
fictional  lens  through  which  to  view the  complex
relationship between household spending on housing
and stock prices.

As part of our comprehensive research methodology,
we also delved into popular  TV shows that  might
offer  observational  insights  into  this  economic
intertwined  relationship.  The  TV  series  "Property
Trading  Chronicles"  and  "Stock  Exchange  Saga"
were  among  the  intriguing  sources  we  explored,
providing  anecdotal  glimpses  into  the  worlds  of
housing  markets  and  stock  trading.  While  not
empirical  studies  in  the  traditional  sense,  these
shows  offered  a  unique  perspective  on  the
intertwining dynamics of housing and stock market
fluctuations.
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In  summary,  the  existing  literature  provides  a
foundation  for  our  investigation  into  the  link
between annual US household spending on housing
and  CME  Group's  stock  price.  By  bridging  the
realms  of  economics,  psychology,  and  popular
culture,  our  study  aims  to  uncover  the  hidden
connections  that  shape  market  behaviors  and shed
light  on  this  surprising  correlation.  With  a  nod to
both scholarly research and fictional narratives, we
embark on this journey with a spirit of curiosity and
a commitment to unraveling the economic mysteries
that lie beneath the roofs and amidst the stock tickers
of our financial landscape.

3. Methodology

To  explore  the  enigmatic  entanglement  between
annual US household spending on housing and the
stock  price  of  CME  Group  (CME),  our  research
team  embarked  on  a  data  odyssey  worthy  of  a
Homeric  epic.  Our  methodological  approach  was
akin to navigating through the labyrinth of Minos,
albeit with more spreadsheets and less mythological
creatures.  We sourced our data primarily  from the
Bureau  of  Labor  Statistics  and  LSEG  Analytics
(Refinitiv),  where  the  statistical  treasures  awaited
our discovery.

The first step in our research odyssey involved the
acquisition of detailed data on annual US household
spending  on  housing,  covering  the  gamut  of
expenses  from mortgage payments  to  maintenance
and everything in between. Annotation of this data
was  akin  to  deciphering  ancient  hieroglyphics,
where each line item held the promise of unlocking
the secrets of household financial behavior.

Simultaneously, we delved into the depths of CME
Group's  stock  price  data,  traversing  through  the
vicissitudes of market fluctuations with the zeal of
intrepid treasure hunters. The stock price, akin to a
mercurial genie confined within the bottle of market
dynamics,  revealed  its  revelations  as  we
meticulously  tracked  its  ebbs  and  flows  over  the
years.

Having amassed this trove of data, we engaged in a
dance with statistical methods that would make even
Pythagoras  himself  take  notice.  The  correlation
analysis,  a  delicate  pas  de  deux  between  housing

expenditure  and  stock  price,  unfolded  under  the
watchful eyes of statistical significance. Hypothesis
testing was our trusty guide through this labyrinth,
leading us to the elusive significance level  of  p <
0.01,  a threshold that  separated the plausible from
the phantasmagorical.

It's  worth  noting  that  we  employed  time-series
analysis  to  capture  the  temporal  nuances  of  the
relationship between annual US household spending
on  housing  and  CME  Group's  stock  price.  This
allowed  us  to  witness  the  unfolding  saga  of  their
interplay,  akin  to  reading  a  gripping  novel  where
each chapter held new revelations and plot twists.

Furthermore,  to  ensure  the  robustness  of  our
findings,  we  subjected  the  data  to  stringent
sensitivity  analysis,  akin  to  stress-testing  the
structural integrity of a financial edifice. We tinkered
with  variables  and  scenarios,  akin  to  a  scientific
alchemist seeking the philosopher's stone, until  the
correlation  remained  steadfast  in  the  face  of
statistical rigor.

As  researchers,  we  understand  the  gravity  of  the
responsibility that comes with navigating uncharted
methodological  waters.  Therefore,  the  choices  we
made  in  this  odyssey  were  not  taken  lightly,  and
each  step  was  scrutinized  with  the  precision  of  a
watchmaker  assembling  the  intricate  gears  of  a
timepiece.

Thus,  armed  with  our  trusty  dataset,  statistical
arsenal,  and  a  touch  of  academic  whimsy,  we
ventured  forth  into  the  realm  of  empirical
investigation  to  untangle  the  roofline  relationship
between  US  household  spending  on  housing  and
CME Group's stock price.

4. Results

The statistical analysis conducted on the relationship
between annual US household spending on housing
and  CME Group's  stock  price  yielded  compelling
results that shed light  on the interwoven nature of
these  seemingly  disparate  economic  factors.  The
correlation  coefficient  obtained  from  our
investigation was a staggering 0.9340040, signifying
a  robust  and  highly  positive  correlation  between
these variables.  It's  as  if  they were two peas  in  a
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statistics  pod,  dancing in perfect  synchrony across
the economic stage.

Further bolstering the strength of this correlation, the
r-squared  value  of  0.8723635  indicates  that  a
substantial portion of the variability in CME Group's
stock price can be attributed to changes in annual US
household spending on housing. It's as if the motions
of the housing market are intricately choreographed
with the movements of the stock market, resulting in
a captivating statistical pas de deux.

Additionally,  the  significance  level  of  p  <  0.01
provides  compelling  evidence  to  reject  the  null
hypothesis,  solidifying  the  validity  of  this
correlation.  In  other  words,  the  probability  of
observing such a strong relationship by mere chance
is  comparable  to  finding  a  needle  in  a  statistical
haystack.

Figure 1. Scatterplot of the variables by year

To  visually  encapsulate  the  robustness  of  this
correlation,  Figure  1  presents  a  scatterplot  that
vividly  depicts  the  tight  clustering  of  data  points,
affirming  the  strong  linear  relationship  between
annual US household spending on housing and CME
Group's stock price. It's as if this scatterplot is the
data visualization equivalent of a perfect duet, with
each point harmonizing with its partner to create a
mesmerizing symphony of economic insight.

In  conclusion,  our  findings  not  only  uncover  the
remarkable  correlation  between  annual  US
household spending on housing and CME Group's
stock price,  but  they also offer  a glimpse into the
intricate  web  of  economic  forces  that  underpin
market dynamics. The implications of this research
resonate  far  beyond  the  realm  of  statistics  and

graphs,  delving  into  the  enigmatic  relationship
between  personal  financial  decisions  and  market
movements. One might say we've lifted the roof on
the  hidden  connections  between  these  economic
indicators,  revealing  a  fascinating  interplay  that
transcends traditional economic analysis.

5. Discussion

The findings of our study provide substantial support
for  the  seemingly  unlikely  hypothesis  that  there
exists a strong and positively correlated relationship
between annual US household spending on housing
and  CME  Group's  stock  price.  The  correlation
coefficient  of  0.9340040  obtained  from  our
statistical analysis echoes the sentiments of previous
research,  highlighting  the  interconnected  nature  of
economic indicators. It seems that the fluctuations in
the  housing  market  are  not  just  a  roof  over  our
heads, but also have a substantial influence on the
trajectory of stock prices, acting as a silent partner in
the dance of market dynamics. 

Our results align with the earlier work of Doe and
Jones  (2019)  who  underscored  the  psychological
underpinnings  of  stock  price  fluctuations.  Delving
deeper  into  our  findings,  one  might  say  that  as
households allocate more resources to housing, the
ripple  effects  are  felt  not  just  in  the  real  estate
market, but also reverberate through the corridors of
the  stock  exchange.  Just  as  the  butterfly  effect
demonstrates  the  interconnectedness  of  seemingly
unrelated  events,  our  study illustrates  the  intricate
web of economic determinants that underlie market
movements.

Moreover, the r-squared value of 0.8723635 signifies
that  changes in  annual  US household spending on
housing  account  for  a  substantial  portion  of  the
variability in CME Group's stock price. It's as if the
housing market wields a significant influence on the
ebb  and  flow  of  stock  prices,  serving  as  a  key
protagonist in the economic narrative. This finding
resonates with the metaphorical portrayal of housing
expenditure as a  supporting actor that  has  stepped
into the limelight of the financial stage. 

The significance level of p < 0.01 further validates
our results, dismissing the notion of this correlation
being  a  statistical  fluke.  As  unlikely  as  finding  a
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statistically  significant  relationship  between
household  spending  on  housing  and  stock  prices
may seem,  our  study has  uncovered  a  compelling
linkage that defies traditional economic analysis.

By  following  an  unconventional  path  that  drew
inspiration from both factual and fictitious sources in
our  literature  review,  we  unlocked  a  novel
perspective on the intertwined relationship between
housing  expenditures  and  stock  prices.  From  the
dramatic portrayals in "The House of Cards" by Doe
to  the  poignant  economic  insights  in  "Home
Economics"  by  Smith,  our  interdisciplinary
approach has  broadened the horizons of  economic
research, displaying that unconventional sources can
yield valuable insights.

In a nutshell, our research contributes a significant
piece  in  the  puzzle  of  economic  interconnections,
shedding  light  on  the  unexpected  yet  robust
correlation between annual US household spending
on housing and CME Group's stock price. It seems
that the economic landscape is rife with surprising
connections,  prompting  us  to  challenge  traditional
boundaries  and embrace the complexity of  market
dynamics with a spirit of curiosity and a twinkle in
our statistical eye.

6. Conclusion

In conclusion, our study illuminates the compelling
relationship between annual US household spending
on housing and CME Group's stock price, painting a
portrait of economic symbiosis that is as intricate as
a strand of DNA (Dynamic Nexus of Abodes). With
a correlation coefficient  akin to a statistical power
couple  and  a  significance  level  robust  enough  to
withstand even the most stringent hypothesis testing,
the evidence speaks volumes. It's as if the housing
market and stock prices are engaged in a waltz of
financial influence, each move choreographed to the
rhythm of the other. Our data visualization in Figure
1 showcases this intricate dance, a visual testament
to the captivating ballet of economic dynamics.

Delving into the deeper implications of our findings,
it's clear that we've tapped into the pulse of not just
economic  indicators,  but  the  beating  heart  of
household behaviors  and market  fluctuations.  This
correlation isn't just a statistic; it's a glimpse into the

very fabric of human financial  decisions,  blending
the personal and the economic into a symphony of
fiscal resonance. We've lifted the roof on the hidden
connections  between  these  seemingly  disparate
economic variables, revealing a tapestry of intricate
interplay that enriches our understanding of market
forces.  In  the  immortal  words  of  Isaac  Newton,
"What goes up must come down, but in the case of
housing  spending  and  CME  Group's  stock  price,
they seem to be on an upward trajectory together."

As we bring this investigation to a close, it's safe to
say that no further research is needed in this area.
We've  unraveled  the  mysteries,  akin  to  a  hostess
unveiling  the  centerpiece  of  an  enigmatic  dinner
party.  The  link  between  household  spending  on
housing and CME Group's stock price is no longer a
question mark; it's an exclamation point in the grand
saga of economic interconnections. It's as if we've
closed the book on this chapter, and the conclusion
is  clear:  the  roof  and  the  trading  floor  are  more
intertwined than we ever imagined.
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