
The Journal of Prankology and Information Systems Copyleft 2024 by The Society for Management Information Systems and Social Shenanigans
2024, Vol. 114, No. 7, 810-840 S5236-6182(3176)3897-7 DOI: 15.1759/453028633863

Associates in Advancement: Exploring the Link Between Management
Information Systems and Mischief Missed
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In this study, we delved into the seemingly unlikely correlation between the number of Associates degrees awarded in Management Information Systems and
the incidence of burglaries in the charming state of Rhode Island. Our research team meticulously analyzed data from the National Center for Education
Statistics and the FBI Criminal Justice Information Services to unravel this enigmatic connection. To our surprise, we uncovered a correlation coefficient of
0.9478559, with a statistically significant p-value of less than 0.01 for the years 2011 to 2021. These findings suggest a noteworthy correlation between the
educational pursuits in managing information and the mishaps of miscreants. Our research not only sheds light on this unconventional association but also
raises intriguing questions about the impact of academic achievements on illicit activities.

In  the  world  of  academia,  researchers  are  often  drawn  to
investigate the most perplexing of connections, no matter how
seemingly bizarre they may be. The intersection of Management
Information  Systems  (MIS)  education  and  criminal  activities
certainly  qualifies  as  one  such  enigmatic  puzzle.  While  the
pursuit of an Associates degree in MIS may appear unrelated to
the mischievous machinations of burglars, our inquisitive minds
have  led  us  to  delve  into  this  unlikely  correlation  in  the
charming state of Rhode Island.

The  allure  of  delving  into  this  unconventional  association
demanded our attention, prompting us to carefully collect and
analyze data from the National Center for Education Statistics
and the FBI Criminal Justice Information Services. Our team of
researchers,  armed  with  statistical  tools  and  a  passion  for
uncovering the unexpected, embarked on a journey to unravel
the mysterious link between educational advancements and the
escapades of evildoers.

Now,  if  you'll  bear  with  me,  I  promise  we'll  unearth  some
fascinating  statistics  that  will  leave  you  feeling  like  you  just
stumbled upon a rare gem in a field of mundane rocks. So, hold
onto your lab coats and let's venture into the realm of education
and crime, where numbers don't lie, but they might just crack a
sly smile at the correlations they reveal!

Review of existing research

The  investigation  into  the  seemingly  peculiar  connection
between  Associates  degrees  awarded  in  Management
Information Systems (MIS) and burglaries in Rhode Island has
prompted an examination of existing literature on related topics.
In "The Impact of Education on Criminal Behavior," Smith et al.
explore the influence of educational pursuits on involvement in
illicit activities. Similarly, Doe's study, "Educational Attainment

and  Criminal  Behavior,"  provides  insights  into  the  potential
correlations between academic achievements and misdemeanors.
Additionally,  Jones'  work,  "Exploring the Role of Technology
Education in Society," sheds light on the broader implications of
technological education on societal behaviors.

Turning to non-fiction literature, works such as "Data Analytics
in Crime Prevention" and "Criminal Minds: Understanding the
Psychology  of  Offenders"  offer  valuable  perspectives  on  the
intersection  of  technology  education  and  criminal  activities.
Furthermore,  fictional  narratives  such  as  "The  Codebreaker's
Dilemma" and "Cyber Sleuth Chronicles" provide imaginative
glimpses into the potential ramifications of information systems
expertise on unlawful endeavors.

As  the  examination  of  the  literature  progressed,  the  research
team also ventured into unexpected sources of  insight.  While
traditional  research  databases  yielded  valuable  scholarly
publications,  the  authors  found  themselves  perusing
unconventional repositories of knowledge, including the backs
of  cereal  boxes,  fortune  cookies,  and  even  the  labels  of
household  cleaning  products.  While  these  unconventional
sources  did  not  provide  scholarly  citations,  they  did  offer  a
refreshing perspective on the intersection of educational pursuits
and  mischievous  behaviors,  albeit  in  a  rather  unconventional
manner.

The diverse array of literature consulted throughout this review
has  served  to  provide  a  comprehensive  foundation  for
understanding  the  potential  link  between  the  attainment  of
Associates degrees in Management Information Systems and the
occurrences of burglaries in Rhode Island. While some sources
have provided rigorous empirical evidence, others have offered
imaginative  speculation,  and  still,  others  have  inspired  a
lighthearted approach to this intriguing research endeavor.
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Now, with the backdrop of literary insights laid before us, let us
delve  into  the  empirical  findings  that  will  shed  light  on  the
fascinating correlation awaiting discovery. Get ready to embark
on  a  whimsical  journey  through  the  world  of  academia  and
mischief, where the unexpected awaits at every turn!

Procedure

Data Collection:

Our research team embarked on a whimsical quest through the
virtual expanse of the internet, navigating the treacherous seas of
data repositories and archives. We scoured the National Center
for Education Statistics (NCES) database for information on the
number  of  Associates  degrees  awarded  in  Management
Information Systems (MIS) in Rhode Island from 2011 to 2021.
Our journey then took an unexpected turn as we voyaged into
the  depths  of  the  FBI  Criminal  Justice  Information  Services
(CJIS) to procure detailed records of reported burglaries in this
charming coastal state.

It  was  a  veritable  treasure  hunt  for  data,  during  which  we
occasionally felt like pirate researchers searching for the elusive
pearls  of  statistical  wisdom.  Armed with our  trusty statistical
software and an insatiable thirst for knowledge, we amassed a
trove of quantitative gems to fuel our analysis.

Data Analysis:

With  our  spoils  of  data  in  hand,  we  set  sail  for  the  equally
uncharted territory of statistical analysis. In a valiant attempt to
make sense of the vast dataset, we subjected it to the rigorous
scrutiny  of  various  statistical  methods,  including  correlation
analysis,  regression  modeling,  and  a  dash  of  multivariate
analysis  for  good  measure.  The  sea  of  numbers  ebbed  and
flowed as we navigated through the waves of hypothesis testing
and  confidence  intervals,  determined  to  uncover  the  hidden
connections lurking beneath the surface.

We employed the tried-and-true Pearson correlation coefficient
to assess the strength and direction of the relationship between
the number of MIS-related Associates degrees awarded and the
incidence  of  burglaries  in  Rhode  Island.  The  statistical
seaworthy vessel of significance testing carried us through the
choppy waters of hypothesis evaluation, ultimately leading us to
the shores of compelling findings.

To complement our quantitative odyssey, we also complemented
our  analysis  with  some  qualitative  insights,  engaging  in
thoughtful  discussions  about  the  plausible  mechanisms  that
could underpin the observed correlation. Our discussions were
akin to philosophical musings on the nature of statistical fate,
albeit with a sprinkle of academic rigor and a pinch of whimsy.

Limitations:

As daring explorers of data, we are not impervious to the perils
of  limitations.  Our  study  is  not  immune  to  the  tides  of
confounding variables that may have eluded our grasp, nor can
we claim exemption from the potential influence of outliers that
may have emerged from the statistical deep. These limitations,
much  like  mischievous  sprites,  occasionally  danced  on  the

fringes of our analysis, reminding us that the path of empirical
inquiry is fraught with uncertainties.

Furthermore,  the  nature  of  our  data  sources  may introduce  a
whiff  of  uncertainty  into  the  conclusions  drawn  from  our
analyses.  While  we endeavored to  hoist  the flag of  reliability
high,  the  inherent  complexities  of  societal  phenomena  and
educational  dynamics  may  add  a  touch  of  intrigue  to  the
interpretations of our findings.

Nevertheless, armed with the compass of scientific rigor and the
spirit of scholarly inquiry, we ventured forth to chart the course
of  our  research,  undeterred  by  the  gusts  of  uncertainty  that
occasionally swept through our data.

Findings

Our  investigation  into  the  connection  between  Associates
degrees  awarded  in  Management  Information  Systems  (MIS)
and the occurrence of burglaries in Rhode Island yielded some
remarkably intriguing results. The data, spanning from 2011 to
2021, revealed a striking correlation coefficient of 0.9478559.
This correlation coefficient, often referred to as "r," indicates a
strong positive linear relationship between the number of MIS
degrees and the incidence of burglaries.

Furthermore,  the  coefficient  of  determination,  denoted  as  r-
squared,  was calculated to be 0.8984308. This value suggests
that approximately 89.84% of the variation in burglary rates can
be  explained by the variation in  the number of  MIS degrees
awarded. In other words, the pursuit of knowledge in managing
information systems appears to be closely intertwined with the
mischievous activities of those up to no good.

The p-value, a stalwart indicator of statistical significance, was
found to be less than 0.01.  This  noteworthy p-value provides
robust  evidence  to  support  the  validity  of  the  observed
correlation. In simpler terms, the likelihood of this correlation
occurring  purely  by  chance  is  less  than  1  in  100,  or  as  we
academics like to say, "statistically significant enough to make a
scientist do a little happy dance."

Figure 1. Scatterplot of the variables by year

Upon  visual  examination  of  the  data,  our  team  created  a
scatterplot (see Fig. 1) that vividly illustrates the strong positive
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association between the number of MIS degrees awarded and
the frequency of burglaries in Rhode Island. The figure provides
a  compelling  visual  narrative  of  how  these  two  seemingly
disparate  variables  are  in  fact  intertwined,  much  like  the
entangled  lines  of  code  in  a  particularly  nefarious  computer
virus.

In  summary,  our  findings  illuminate  a  surprising  relationship
between  educational  pursuits  in  MIS  and  the  incidence  of
burglaries in Rhode Island. This correlation not only challenges
conventional  wisdom  but  also  underscores  the  intricate
connections that can emerge in the complex tapestry of societal
phenomena.  The  implications  of  this  link  between  academic
achievements and criminal behavior are bound to spark lively
debates and potentially inspire a new wave of interdisciplinary
research.  After  all,  who  knew  that  the  study  of  information
management could hold the key to unraveling the adventures of
modern-day bandits in the Ocean State?

Discussion

The results  of  our  study  have  revealed  a  striking  association
between  the  number  of  Associates  degrees  awarded  in
Management Information Systems (MIS) and the prevalence of
burglaries  in  the  picturesque  state  of  Rhode  Island.  This
unexpected  correlation,  with  a  correlation  coefficient  of
0.9478559  and  a  p-value  of  less  than  0.01,  raises  intriguing
questions about the underlying mechanisms linking educational
pursuits  in  information  management  to  illicit  activities.  Our
findings not only support prior research examining the influence
of education on criminal behavior but also provide a whimsical
twist to the traditional paradigm of academic achievements.

Harkening back to  the literature  review,  our  research journey
took  us  through  a  diverse  array  of  sources,  from  scholarly
publications to unconventional repositories of knowledge. The
lighthearted approach showcased in fictional narratives such as
"The Codebreaker's  Dilemma" and "Cyber  Sleuth Chronicles"
unexpectedly resonated with the serious empirical  findings of
our study. Who would have thought that the comical musings
found on the backs of cereal boxes and the enigmatic messages
nestled  within  fortune  cookies  could  offer  a  refreshing
perspective  on  the  intersection  of  academic  pursuits  and
mischievous behaviors?

In  aligning  with  the  literature  on  the  potential  influence  of
education on criminal activities, our research provides empirical
evidence  to  support  the  notion  that  academic  achievements,
particularly  in  the  realm  of  information  management,  may
indeed play a role in shaping societal behaviors. The correlation
coefficient  of  0.9478559  signifies  a  robust  positive  linear
relationship between the number of MIS degrees awarded and
the frequency of burglaries, illuminating the entangled nature of
academic pursuits and criminal mischief.

The coefficient of determination,  with a value of r-squared at
0.8984308,  underscores  the  considerable  influence  of
educational endeavors in MIS on the variation in burglary rates.
This  value  serves  as  a  quirky  reminder  that  approximately
89.84% of the mischief in burglary rates can be attributed to the
pursuit  of  knowledge  in  managing  information  systems  -  a

statistic  that  undoubtedly  prompts  a  raised  eyebrow  or  two
within academic circles.

The statistical significance of our findings, as evidenced by the
p-value of less than 0.01, is akin to stumbling upon a rare gem in
the world of statistical analysis - a delight that may even elicit a
spontaneous  celebratory  dance  from  the  most  stoic  of
researchers. Our study's results not only challenge conventional
wisdom but  also beckon researchers  to  explore  the uncharted
territories  of  interdisciplinary  inquiry,  where  the  unexpected
awaits at every turn.

In the grand tapestry of academic research, our study serves as a
whimsical reminder that even the most improbable connections
can  yield  remarkable  insights.  The  link  between  Associates
degrees in MIS and the shadowy exploits of burglars in Rhode
Island  stands  as  a  testament  to  the  uncanny  interplay  of
academic pursuits and societal phenomena. As we conclude this
discussion, we leave you with a playful nod to the unexpected
twists and turns that await researchers who dare to embark on
unconventional  scholarly endeavors.  After  all,  who knew that
the world of academic research held such tantalizing surprises?

Conclusion

In conclusion, our investigation into the correlation between the
awarding  of  Associates  degrees  in  Management  Information
Systems (MIS) and the incidence of burglaries in Rhode Island
has  uncovered  a  rather  unexpected  relationship.  Our  results
revealed a  strikingly high correlation coefficient,  indicating a
strong  positive  linear  relationship  between  these  seemingly
disparate  variables.  It  seems that  the pursuit  of  knowledge in
managing information systems might just be closely intertwined
with the mischievous activities of those up to no good. It's as if
the  burglars  are  attempting  to  "break  into"  the  world  of
information  management,  albeit  with  less  than  honorable
intentions - talk about a data breach of a different kind!

The statistically significant p-value further supports the validity
of our findings, leaving little room to attribute this correlation to
chance.  As we dive deeper into the statistical sea,  it  becomes
increasingly clear that the link between educational pursuits in
MIS and burglary rates is no mere coincidence. It appears that
these two realms, one of academic advancement and the other of
illicit  activities,  have found themselves tangled in an intricate
web  of  statistical  connection,  much  like  a  sneaky  algorithm
hidden within a labyrinth of code.

Our study not only sheds light on this curious correlation but
also  launches  a  fruitful  discussion  within  the  scientific
community.  The  implications  of  this  unexpected  relationship
between  academic  achievements  and  criminal  behavior  are
bound to intrigue researchers from diverse fields. It seems that
there  is  more  to  the  world  of  information  management  than
meets the eye, and perhaps, in unraveling the mysteries of MIS,
we have  unearthed  a  hidden  connection  to  the  adventures  of
modern-day  bandits  in  the  Ocean  State.  Who  knew  that
unraveling  the  mysteries  of  academic  pursuits  could  help  us
understand the escapades of mischief makers?
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In light of these compelling findings, it is safe to say that further
research in this area may not yield as much value as one might
hope. Sometimes, a statistical anomaly such as this one is best
left  as  a  quirky  quirk  of  the  scientific  world,  a  charming
statistical  oddity  that  reminds  us  that  the  universe  is  full  of
delightful  surprises.  As  the  curtain  falls  on  this  particular
exploration,  we can take solace in the fact that our scholarly
pursuit has uncovered a correlation that is as intriguing as it is
unexpected. So, let's raise a toast to the curious connections that
science continues to unveil, and embrace the baffling beauty of
statistical serendipity.

No  more  research  needed  in  this  area  -  it's  time  for  these
findings  to  safely  reside  in  the  annals  of  quirky  statistical
oddities!
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