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Abstract

Lorem ipsum dolor sit amet, consectetur adipiscing elit. The age-old debate on the value of studying 
history has finally collided with the world of stock market analyses. In this peculiar study, we reveal the 
shocking connection between the number of Associates degrees awarded in History and the fluctuating 
stock price of Centene Corporation. Our research team embraced the challenge of unraveling this 
enigmatic relationship by delving into the data from the National Center for Education Statistics and LSEG
Analytics (Refinitiv). Through rigorous statistical analysis, we uncovered a correlation coefficient of 
0.9884005 and p < 0.01 for the time span from 2011 to 2021, indicating an unusually high correlation 
between these two seemingly disparate variables. Nevertheless, while our findings may raise eyebrows, 
it's essential to approach these results with a healthy dose of skepticism and humor. This unexpected 
connection between historical education and corporate stock performance certainly raises intriguing 
questions and leaves us contemplating whether there are hidden lessons from the past that could impact 
future financial trends. Our research encourages a lighthearted exploration of the unexpected twists and 
turns found within the intersection of colleges and the stock market, and we hope our findings spark future
research to unravel the mysteries of this unforeseen linkage.

Copyleft 2024 Center for Research.  No rights reserved.

1. Introduction

     History has often been regarded as a
subject  firmly  rooted  in  the  past,  but  our
research  has  unearthed  an  unexpected
twist that has sent shockwaves through the
world  of  finance.  As  we  delve  into  the
unlikely  correlation  between  Associates

degrees awarded in History and the stock
price  of  Centene  Corporation,  we  embark
on  a  journey  that  defies  conventional
wisdom  and  invites  a  healthy  dose  of
skepticism, alongside a generous sprinkle of
humor.
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     The  very  notion  of  delving  into  the
connection  between  historical  education
and corporate stock performance may elicit
a quizzical eyebrow raise or two. However,
much like the intrepid explorers of yore, we
were  undeterred  by  the  unconventional
nature of our quest and forged ahead into
the uncharted territory of statistical analysis
and historical trends.

     Our  research,  conducted  with  both
scholarly rigor and a playful spirit, reveals a
correlation coefficient that would make even
the most seasoned statistician do a double-
take. With a coefficient of 0.9884005 and a
p-value of less than 0.01, our findings defy
the  odds  and  affirm  the  existence  of  a
remarkably high correlation between these
seemingly unrelated variables.

     One might  wonder if  our researchers
were  simply  "making  history"  with  these
findings,  but  we  assure  you  that  our
methods were grounded in meticulous data
collection  and  rigorous  analysis.  We
combed through the troves of data from the
National Center for Education Statistics and
LSEG  Analytics  (Refinitiv)  with  the
determination  of  a  historian  deciphering
ancient manuscripts and the precision of a
seasoned  financial  analyst  scrutinizing
market trends.

     While our findings may elicit a chuckle or
two and perhaps even provoke some raised
eyebrows, we implore our readers to join us
in  considering  the  implications  of  this
unexpected connection. Could it be that the
echoes  of  the  past  resound in  the  flux  of
future financial markets? Is there a lesson
hidden  within  the  annals  of  history  that
could offer  valuable insights for  navigating
the labyrinthine world of corporate stocks?

     As we present our findings, we invite our
esteemed  colleagues  to  embark  on  this
whimsical journey with us and embrace the
delightful  unpredictability  of  scholarly
exploration.  After  all,  who  would  have
thought  that  the  study  of  history  and  the

stock  market  could  collide  in  such  an
unforeseen manner? Perhaps it's a sign that
even in the most unexpected places, there
are  hidden  gems  of  insight  waiting  to  be
unearthed.

     So, with a twinkle in our eyes and a nod
to the whims of fate, we invite you to join us
in unpacking the confounding conundrum of
the  past's  influence  on  the  present  and
future  of  financial  markets.  Let's  navigate
this  uncharted  territory  with  curiosity,  a
touch of mirth, and a deep appreciation for
the delightful absurdity of scholarly inquiry.

2. Literature Review

The first scholarly work to shed light on the
connection between Associates degrees in
History  and  corporate  stock  performance
comes  from  Smith  et  al.  (2015),  who
conducted  an  in-depth  analysis  of
educational trends and their potential impact
on  financial  markets.  Their  study,  titled
"Historical Education and Economic Tides,"
set the stage for our own investigation into
this  peculiar  phenomenon.  While  their
findings hinted at potential correlations, they
could scarcely have anticipated the wild ride
of discovery that awaited us.

Building  upon  this  foundation,  Doe  and
Jones  (2018)  delved  into  the  historical
underpinnings of  stock  market  fluctuations
in  their  paper  "Unearthing  the  Past:  A
Historical  Perspective  on  Financial
Volatility."  Their  exploration  of  historical
narratives  as  a  lens  for  understanding
market  dynamics  sparked  further  curiosity
within  our  research  team,  propelling  us
deeper  into  the  labyrinth  of  unexpected
connections.

In  "The  Past  as  a  Crystal  Ball:
Unconventional  Wisdom  in  Finance"  by
Sage  (2020),  a  thought-provoking
exploration of historical analogies and their
relevance to modern financial forecasts, our
research encountered a tantalizing thread of
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inquiry.  Sage's  work  beckoned  us  to
consider  whether  the  echoes  of  history
could reverberate in the rise and fall of stock
prices, setting the stage for the unearthing
of our own surprising revelations.

Turning to non-fiction books, "The History of
Money"  by  Richards  (2016)  offered  a
comprehensive  overview  of  monetary
systems throughout  the  ages,  providing  a
historical backdrop to our investigation into
the  interplay  between  education  and
financial  trends.  We couldn't  resist  delving
into the compelling narratives woven in "The
Rise  and  Fall  of  Stock  Empires"  by
Goldstein (2017), even as the connection to
our research grew more tenuous with each
flip of the page.

Venturing into fiction, the timeless tale of "A
Connecticut Yankee in King Arthur's Court"
by  Twain  (1889)  beckoned  with  its
whimsical  portrayal  of  time  travel  and
historical  juxtapositions,  sparking  a  playful
speculation  within  our  team  about  the
fantastical  scenarios  of  historical  meddling
in  financial  markets.  While  "The  Da  Vinci
Code"  by  Brown  (2003)  sent  our
imaginations  soaring  with  its  cryptic
historical puzzles, we reluctantly conceded
that the quest for answers lay beyond the
confines of Dan Brown's captivating fiction.

In  a  daring  departure  from  conventional
sources,  we  combed  through  seemingly
unrelated materials,  including grocery lists,
overheard  conversations  at  coffee  shops,
and  even  the enigmatic  symbols  adorning
CVS  receipts,  in  a  whimsical  attempt  to
unravel  the  mysteries  of  this  unexpected
correlation.  While  the  relevancy  of  these
unconventional sources may be dubious at
best,  we  couldn't  resist  the  temptation  to
infuse our scholarly pursuits with a dash of
delightful absurdity.

As  our  exploration  transcended  the
boundaries of traditional sources, we found
ourselves teetering on the edge of scholarly
inquiry  and  comedic  curiosity,  embracing

the  whimsical  journey  of  uncovering  the
unexpected connections between historical
education and corporate stock performance.
While our foray into the literary landscape
may  appear  lighthearted,  we  remained
steadfast  in  our  pursuit  of  unraveling  this
confounding conundrum with scholarly rigor
and a spirited sense of adventure.

3. Our approach & methods

To  unravel  the  mystifying  correlation
between  the  confounding  variables  of
Associates  degrees  in  History  and
Centene's  stock  price,  our  research  team
embarked on an adventure that would make
Indiana Jones' archaeological exploits look
like child's play. We gathered data from the
National Center for Education Statistics and
LSEG  Analytics  (Refinitiv),  scouring  the
virtual landscapes of the internet to uncover
the  elusive  threads  that  weave  these
seemingly unrelated phenomena together.

Our first  step,  akin to a Sherlock Holmes-
esque  investigation,  involved  meticulously
collecting data on the number of Associates
degrees  awarded  in  History  from  2011  to
2021.  We  treaded  through  the  intricate
labyrinth  of  academic  institutions  and
statistical repositories, with the precision of
a treasure hunter meticulously mapping out
hidden troves of historical artifacts.

Next, we set our sights on Centene's stock
price,  delving  deep  into  the  financial  data
with  the  tenacity  of  a  seasoned  detective
unraveling a complex web of clues. Armed
with spreadsheets and statistical tools, our
team  combed  through  the  fluctuations  in
Centene's  stock  price  over  the  same
timeframe,  piecing  together  the  jigsaw
puzzle  of  market  trends  and  historical
patterns.

With  our  trove  of  data  in  hand,  we
summoned the spirits of statistical analysis
and  set  forth  to  unveil  the  hidden
connections.  Our  team  employed  the
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formidable  powers  of  correlation  analysis,
conducting rigorous statistical tests with the
gravity  of  astrophysicists  charting  the
movements  of  celestial  bodies.  We
calculated the correlation coefficient with all
the precision of a mathematician calculating
the trajectory of a space probe, and lo and
behold,  a  correlation  coefficient  of
0.9884005 emerged, accompanied by a p-
value  of  less  than  0.01,  signifying  a
statistically  significant  relationship  that  left
even  our  research  team  marveling  at  the
fortuitousness of our discovery.

In  our  quest  to  scrutinize  this  improbable
correlation,  we applied  multiple  regression
analysis,  wielded  with  the  finesse  of  a
maestro  conducting  a  symphony,  to
ascertain whether other variables might be
exerting  clandestine  influences  on  our
findings. Our statistical toolkit encompasses
robust techniques that would make even a
statistics  professor  raise  an  eyebrow  in
admiration.

To ensure the resilience and validity of our
findings,  we  subjected  our  analysis  to
rigorous  sensitivity  tests,  interrogating  our
data with the relentless determination of a
prosecuting  attorney  cross-examining  a
suspect. We probed the outer limits of our
statistical  model,  shoring  up  our  results
against  potential  fluctuations  and
anomalies,  with  the  vigilance  of  a  sentry
guarding the castle of scientific rigor.

In  the  spirit  of  scholarly  camaraderie,  we
acknowledge the inherent limitations of our
study. While our research has unearthed an
astonishing  correlation,  we  cannot
definitively  assert  causation.  However,
much  like  the  enigmatic  puzzles  that
historians unravel, our findings invite further
exploration  and  offer  a  whimsical  glimpse
into  the  delightful  unpredictability  of
scholarly inquiry.

4. Results

Our rigorous exploration of  the connection
between  Associates  degrees  awarded  in
History  and  Centene's  stock  price  has
unveiled  a  correlation  coefficient  of
0.9884005,  an  r-squared  value  of
0.9769356, and a p-value of less than 0.01,
all within the time frame of 2011 to 2021. In
simple  terms,  this  means  there's  an
incredibly strong and statistically significant
relationship between the number of history
degrees conferred and the fluctuating price
of Centene's stock.

Fig.  1  depicts  the  scatterplot  that  visually
encapsulates  this  unexpected  correlation.
It's like witnessing the fateful collision of two
long-lost friends at a high school reunion –
surprising,  bizarre,  and  utterly  captivating.
The scatterplot  essentially  tells  the  tale of
history  and  finance  coming  together  in  a
statistical  tango,  leaving  us  all  befuddled
and amused.

The  strength  of  this  correlation  is  akin  to
finding a fossilized T-Rex wearing a top hat
–  utterly  improbable,  yet  undeniably
intriguing. It's a reminder that the mysteries
of  the  statistical  world  often  surpass  the
boundaries  of  expectation,  much  like
stumbling  upon  a  unicorn  in  a  herd  of
horses.

Figure 1. Scatterplot of the variables by year

We must marvel at the sheer improbability
of  this  connection  between  seemingly
unrelated  entities.  It's  as  though  Sherlock
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Holmes  and  Wall  Street  struck  up  an
unlikely  partnership,  solving  financial
mysteries steeped in the annals of history.
The  statistical  significance  beckons  us  to
consider  the  possibility  that  history's
whispers reverberate in the financial winds,
shaping  the  trajectory  of  stock  prices  in
ways we never anticipated.

These  findings  urge  us  to  embrace  the
whimsical  and  the  unexpected  in  our
scholarly pursuits. After all, who would have
guessed  that  an  Associates  degree  in
History  could  hold  such  sway  over  a
corporation's  stock  performance?  It's  like
discovering  that  the  Eiffel  Tower  and  the
Great  Wall  of  China  have  a  secret
correspondence that even the most intrepid
traveler overlooked.

Our results not only provoke a healthy dose
of  skepticism  but  also  inspire  a  sense  of
wonder  at  the  uncharted  territories  of
statistical  exploration.  As  we  navigate  this
perplexing landscape,  we're reminded that
while  statistics  may  be  the  language  of
certainty,  they  occasionally  vault  into  the
realm  of  delightful  absurdity,  leaving  us
astounded and grinning in disbelief.

5. Discussion

In the realm of improbable connections, our
study  has  unraveled  a  linkage  between
Associates degrees in History and the stock
price of Centene Corporation that is akin to
stumbling  upon  a  unicorn  in  a  herd  of
horses.  The  statistical  tango  between
historical  education  and  corporate  finance
has  left  us  all  bemused  and  bewildered,
much like witnessing the fateful collision of
two  long-lost  friends  at  a  high  school
reunion  –  surprising,  bizarre,  and  utterly
captivating.

Our findings not only echo the subtle hints
of potential correlations in prior research but
catapult us into a realm of statistical whimsy
and  wonder.  Building  upon  the  scholarly

explorations  of  historical  education  and
financial  markets  by  Smith  et  al.  (2015),
Doe and  Jones (2018),  and Sage (2020),
our  study  serves  as  the  whimsical
culmination  of  this  intellectual  journey.  We
have ventured into uncharted territories of
statistical  absurdity,  embracing  the
unexpected  with  scholarly  rigor  and  a
spirited sense of adventure.

It's  as  though  Sherlock  Holmes  and  Wall
Street  struck  up  an  unlikely  partnership,
solving  financial  mysteries  steeped  in  the
annals  of  history.  This  unexpected
correlation  urges  us  to  consider  whether
history's  whispers  reverberate  in  the
financial  winds,  shaping  the  trajectory  of
stock prices in ways we never anticipated.

Our  results  may seem like  a  fossilized  T-
Rex wearing a top hat – utterly improbable,
yet  undeniably  intriguing.  The  statistical
significance  of  this  connection  begs  us  to
reconsider  the  boundaries  of  statistical
inquiry  and  marvel  at  the  whimsical  turns
that await in the exploration of unexpected
correlations.

In the spirit of whimsy and scholarly pursuit,
we urge future researchers to embrace the
delightful absurdity of unexpected statistical
relationships. While our findings may raise
eyebrows,  they  prompt  a  lighthearted
exploration  of  the  mysteries  that  pervade
the realm of statistical inquiry. After all, who
would  have  guessed  that  an  Associates
degree in History could hold such sway over
a corporation's stock performance? It's like
discovering  that  the  Eiffel  Tower  and  the
Great  Wall  of  China  have  a  secret
correspondence that even the most intrepid
traveler overlooked.

Our  study  serves  as  a  testament  to  the
boundless  curiosity  that  fuels  scholarly
pursuits,  transcending  the  boundaries  of
conventional  inquiry  to  embrace  the
whimsical  and  the  improbable.  As  we
navigate  this  confounding  landscape,  we
are  reminded  that  statistics,  in  their
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unyielding pursuit  of  certainty,  occasionally
traverse  into  the  realm  of  delightful
absurdity,  leaving  us  astounded  and
grinning in disbelief.

6. Conclusion

In  conclusion,  our  study has illuminated a
most unexpected and tantalizing connection
between  the  conferral  of  Associates
degrees in History and the undulating dance
of Centene's stock price. Our findings, with
a  correlation  coefficient  that  practically
jumps off the charts at 0.9884005 and a p-
value  that  gleefully  taunts  convention  by
dipping  under  0.01,  have  left  us  all
marveling at the whims of statistical fate.

It's  as  if  the  muses  of  history  have
conspired  with  the  capricious  spirits  of
finance to craft a narrative so improbable, it
would  make  even  the  most  seasoned
statistician  do  a  double  take.  Picture  this:
Aristotle and Warren Buffett  engaging in a
riveting  game  of  financial  charades,  their
enigmatic gestures shaping the very market
movements  we  tirelessly  endeavor  to
unravel.

Yet, in the spirit of scholarly inquiry, we must
approach  these  findings  with  a  discerning
eye  and  a  hearty  chuckle.  The  statistical
saga that has unfolded before us is akin to
stumbling upon a treasure map in a math
textbook  –  an  unexpected  adventure  that
both confounds and delights.

Our  plea  to  our  esteemed  colleagues  is
simple: let us bask in the bewildering beauty
of  statistical  synchronicity  and  regard  this
unexpected link between history and stock
prices as a delightful enigma, a tantalizing
tease  that  beckons  us  to  savor  the
lighthearted  absurdity  of  scholarly
exploration.

In  the  grand  symphony  of  statistics,  our
research notes a resounding crescendo,  a
lyrical interplay between historical education
and  the  capricious  sway  of  corporate

stocks. It's a reminder that even in the most
unassuming  corners  of  academic  inquiry,
there  are  echoes  of  wonder  and
bemusement waiting to be uncovered.

So,  with  a  merry  twirl  and  a  tip  of  the
metaphorical  hat  to the whims of  fate,  we
assert that no further research is needed in
this  peculiar  realm  where  the  annals  of
history  and  the  fluctuations  of  finance
converge  in  a  harmonious  cacophony  of
statistical delight. After all,  some mysteries
are  best  left  unsolved,  like  the  enigma of
why anyone would choose to study history
instead of chasing gold in the stock market.
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