
*The Consortium for Renewable Energy Advancement and 
Development Review
2024 Vol. 15, No. 8, 518-540

Copyleft The Consortium for Renewable Energy 
Advancement and Development, no rights reserved.  
Contents may be shared with whoever you feel like.  They 
can be copied, emailed, posted to a list-serv, printed out and
tacked on a colleague's office door. Whatever you want. 

SOLAR-POWERED SAVINGS: ILLUMINATING THE
CORRELATION BETWEEN SOLAR POWER IN

RWANDA AND THE QUEST FOR BUDGET
BARGAINS

Caleb Harrison, Addison Thompson, Gina P Tompkins

Center for Research

Our research delves into the curious connection between the increasing solar power generation in 
Rwanda and the intensity of Google searches for "dollar store near me". While the association might 
seem as unlikely as finding a discount toaster in a dollar store, we conducted a rigorous analysis 
using data from the Energy Information Administration and Google Trends. Surprisingly, our findings
reveal a remarkably strong correlation coefficient of 0.9915372 and a statistically significant p-value 
< 0.01 for the period spanning from 2007 to 2021. Perhaps this illuminates a bright new path for 
solar energy research or simply suggests that people are on the hunt for affordable trinkets after 
saving on electricity bills. Either way, our research sheds light on an unexpected and amusing 
correlation that is sure to spark a few knowing chuckles.

In  the  illustrious  world  of  academia,
where  serious  faces  and  even  more
serious  statistical  analyses  reign
supreme,  it  is  not  often  that  one
encounters  a  research  topic  as  peculiar
and  eyebrow-raising  as  the  unlikely
correlation  between  solar  power
generation  in  Rwanda  and  the  fervent
quest for budget bargains at dollar stores.
Yet,  here  we  are,  embarking  on  a
scholarly  journey  that  traverses  the
realms  of  renewable  energy  and  frugal
shopping,  proving  that  research  can
illuminate  the  most  unexpected
connections  –  much  like  a  motion-
activated solar-powered garden light.

While the notion of solar power and dollar
store  searches  being  intertwined  may
initially seem as incongruous as pairing a
tuxedo  with  flip-flops,  our  intrepid
research  team  could  not  resist  delving
into this peculiar pairing. Armed with an
arsenal  of  statistical  tools,  data sources,

and a healthy dose of skepticism, we set
out  to  investigate  whether  there  was
more  to  this  correlation  than meets  the
eye – or the photovoltaic cell.

As  we  tiptoed  through  the  labyrinth  of
data, we found ourselves confronted with
the  sunny  statistics  of  solar  energy
generation in Rwanda, where the pursuit
of  sustainable  and  environmentally
friendly power sources has been akin to a
game of "which came first, the solar panel
or  the  egg?"  Simultaneously,  the  virtual
footprints  of  individuals  embarking  on
quests  for  affordable  treasures  at  dollar
stores via Google searches danced in our
Excel  sheets,  revealing  a  narrative  that
seemed as improbable as stumbling upon
a  mint-condition  lava  lamp  in  the
clearance section of a dollar store.

In this paper, we present the findings of
our  unconventional  investigation,
unveiling  a  correlation  coefficient  of
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0.9915372 that is as dazzling as a newly-
installed  solar  array  on  a  clear  day.  By
leveraging  data  from  the  Energy
Information  Administration  to  quantify
solar  power  production  and  Google
Trends  to  track  the  ebb  and  flow  of
"dollar store near me" searches, we were
able  to  shed  light  on  a  connection  that
will  undoubtedly  raise  a  few  eyebrows
and, hopefully, elicit more than a few wry
grins from our esteemed colleagues.

As  we  dive  into  the  depths  of  this
unexpected  correlation,  buckle  up  for  a
ride  that  is  as  illuminating  as  a  solar-
powered  LED  flashlight  and  as
delightfully perplexing as stumbling upon
a knockoff version of a famous brand in a
dollar  store.  After  all,  in  the  realm  of
research, sometimes the most surprising
discoveries  are  found  in  the  most
unexpected places – much like a hidden
gem unearthed at the bottom of a bargain
bin.

LITERATURE REVIEW

The  association  between  solar  power
generation  and  consumer  behavior  has
been a  topic  of  great  interest  in  recent
years.  Smith  and  Doe  (2018)  found  a
significant  positive  relationship  between
solar  energy  adoption  and  consumer
spending  patterns,  highlighting  the
potential impact of renewable energy on
economic activities. Similarly, Jones et al.
(2019) explored the societal implications
of  solar power integration and observed
shifts  in  consumer  preferences  for
sustainable  products.  These  studies
underscore  the  intricate  interplay
between sustainable energy sources and
consumer  behavior,  laying  the
groundwork for our investigation into the
unexpected  correlation  between  solar
power generation in Rwanda and Google
searches for "dollar store near me".

Moving  beyond  the  scholarly  realm,
works  such  as  "The  Solar  Future"  by
Green  (2020)  and  "Clean  Energy  for
Dummies"  by  Eco-Watts  (2017)  provide
insights  into  the  evolving  landscape  of

renewable energy and its potential effects
on various facets of society. On the other
hand,  fictional  narratives  like  "Solar
Flare" by Ray Star and "The Dollar Store
Diaries"  by  Penny  Pincher  offer
imaginative  perspectives  that,  while  not
rooted in empirical data, explore themes
that resonate with our research focus.

In a departure from traditional sources of
scholarly  inquiry,  we  also  delved  into
unconventional  literature,  perusing  the
backs  of  shampoo  bottles  and  fortune
cookie  messages  in  pursuit  of  hidden
wisdom. While the scientific rigor of these
sources  may  be  questionable,  we  were
determined to leave no stone unturned in
our quest for knowledge – and perhaps a
bit of lighthearted amusement amidst the
rigorous academic pursuit.

As  we  navigate  through  the  diverse
landscape  of  literature  and
unconventional  sources,  it  becomes
evident  that  the  intersection  of  solar
power generation and consumer behavior
is a rich tapestry of inquiry, teeming with
potential  insights  and  unexpected
connections. Through our own study, we
aim  to  add  a  colorful  thread  to  this
tapestry,  one  that  sparkles  with  the
whimsy of an unexpected correlation and
the promise of solar-powered savings.

METHODOLOGY

To  uncover  the  enigmatic  relationship
between  solar  power  generation  in
Rwanda and the fervent pursuit of budget
bargains encapsulated in Google searches
for "dollar  store near me",  our research
team  embarked  on  a  methodological
odyssey  that  was  as  intriguing  as  a
mysterious item found in the depths of a
dollar store's clearance aisle.

Data Collection:

In our quest for  knowledge,  we scoured
the digital landscape, navigating through
the virtual jungles of information with the
agility  of  a  solar-powered  chimpanzee
swinging from tree to tree. Our primary
data  sources  included  the  Energy
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Information  Administration's  database,
where  we  obtained  comprehensive  and
meticulously-maintained  records  of  solar
power generation in Rwanda from 2007 to
2021.  Additionally,  we  harnessed  the
dynamic biodiversity of Google Trends to
capture  the  temporal  ebbs  and flows of
searches for  "dollar  store  near  me"  and
create  a  veritable  portrait  of  budget
bargain  hunters  traversing  the  digital
savannah.

The Enigmatic Algorithms:

With  the  digital  artifacts  in  hand,  we
delved  into  the  mysterious  realm  of
algorithms, where number-crunching and
statistical  sleuthing  were  akin  to
deciphering  the  ancient  hieroglyphs  of
correlation and regression. Our research
team  invoked  the  mystical  powers  of
statistical  software,  summoning  the
esoteric capabilities of  R and Python, to
weave an intricate  web of  mathematical
analyses  designed  to  unveil  the  hidden
connections between solar power and the
allure of discount trinkets.

Unraveling the Correlation:

Fuelled by countless cups of coffee and an
unwavering determination reminiscent of
a caffeine-fueled adventurer in search of
the Holy Grail, we subjected our data to a
grueling  series  of  statistical  tests.  From
Pearson's correlation coefficient to time-
series analysis, we probed the depths of
our  findings  with  an  almost  obsessive
fervor,  as  if  peering  through  a  high-
powered  telescope  in  pursuit  of  the
elusive  cosmic  unity  that  binds  solar
power and dollar store quests.

Reliability and Validity:

As we journeyed through the labyrinth of
statistical significance and effect size, we
maintained  a  vigilant  eye  for  potential
confounding  variables  and  spurious
correlations that threatened to derail our
scholarly  expedition.  Through  rigorous
sensitivity  analyses  and  robustness
checks, we fortified the foundations of our
findings,  ensuring  that  our  conclusions
were as sturdy as a well-constructed solar

panel  array  and  as  dependable  as  the
perennial availability of discount Reese's
Pieces at a dollar store.

Ethical Considerations:

In our relentless pursuit of knowledge, we
remained steadfast in upholding the noble
principles  of  research  ethics,  navigating
the  treacherous  terrain  of  data  privacy
and integrity with the grace of a tightrope
walker in a solar-powered circus. With the
utmost  respect  for  the  sanctity  of
personal  information,  we  shielded  the
identities of digital adventurers captured
in our Google Trends data, ensuring that
their  virtual  wanderings  through  the
aisles  of  digital  dollar  stores  remained
shrouded in anonymity.

In presenting our findings, we invite our
esteemed  colleagues  to  join  us  in
unraveling  this  captivating  tale  of
unexpected connections, as we shed light
on a  correlation  that  is  as  curious  as  a
solar-powered dancing flower swaying to
an  unheard  melody.  As  we  unveil  the
results of our methodological escapades,
we trust  that our  readers will  find both
enlightenment  and  amusement  in  this
scholarly  expedition  that  transcends  the
boundaries  of  conventional  research,
much  like  stumbling  upon  a  whimsical
unicorn-themed  mug  in  a  dollar  store
brimming with peculiar treasures.

RESULTS

In  this  section,  we  present  the
illuminating  results  of  our  investigation
into  the  uncharted  territory  of  the
correlation  between  solar  power
generation  in  Rwanda  and  the  fervent
hunt for budget bargains at dollar stores,
as revealed by Google searches for "dollar
store near me".  Our  analysis  revealed a
correlation coefficient of 0.9915372, an r-
squared value of 0.9831461, and a p-value
of less than 0.01 for the period spanning
from 2007  to  2021.  These  results  shine
bright like a high-wattage solar-powered
floodlight,  leaving  no  room  for  doubt
about  the  robustness  and  statistical
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significance  of  the  relationship  between
these seemingly unrelated phenomena.

The  strong  correlation  coefficient  of
0.9915372  suggests  that  the  connection
between  solar  power  generation  in
Rwanda  and  the  quest  for  budget
bargains  at  dollar  stores  is  as
unmistakable  as  a  neon  sign  in  a  dark
alley.  This  finding  dances  across  the
academic  stage,  dazzling  skeptics  and
supporters  alike  with  its  resilience  to
statistical scrutiny. The r-squared value of
0.9831461  further  emphasizes  the
tightness  of  the  relationship,  indicating
that  approximately  98.31%  of  the
variance  in  "dollar  store  near  me"
searches can be explained by the variance
in solar power generation in Rwanda. It's
as  if  the  solar  panels  themselves  are
beaming out a message: "Come find your
bargains here!"

Yet, we must not overlook the significance
of  the  p-value  being  less  than  0.01,  a
result that is about as rare as finding an
unopened  pack  of  batteries  at  a  dollar
store.  This  p-value  reinforces  the
robustness  of  the  correlation,  providing
evidence  that  the  relationship  between
these  two  variables  is  not  the  result  of
mere chance but is,  in fact,  a bona fide
connection worthy of scholarly attention.

Figure 1. Scatterplot of the variables by year

Our comprehensive analysis culminates in
the presentation of a scatterplot (Fig. 1)
that visually encapsulates the strength of
the  correlation  between  solar  power
generation  in  Rwanda  and  Google

searches for "dollar store near me". This
chart  serves  as  a  veritable  beacon,
illuminating  the  unmistakable  link
between  these  two  seemingly  disparate
domains  with  all  the  subtlety  of  a
fireworks display in broad daylight.

In  summary,  our  results  unequivocally
demonstrate  a  remarkable  association
between  solar  power  generation  in
Rwanda and the intensity of searches for
budget  bargains  at  dollar  stores.  This
unexpected  correlation  may  have  wide-
reaching  implications  for  both  the
renewable  energy  sector  and  the  retail
industry,  shedding light  on a connection
that  is  as  surprising  as  finding  a  gold-
plated  trinket  in  a  dollar  store  treasure
hunt.

DISCUSSION

Our findings provide compelling evidence
for the unexpected yet undeniably potent
correlation between the burgeoning solar
power  generation  in  Rwanda  and  the
zealous  pursuit  of  affordable  goodies  at
dollar  stores.  While  the  notion  of  solar
panels whispering sweet bargain secrets
to frugal shoppers might initially elicit a
chuckle,  our  results  underscore  the
robustness of this remarkable association.

Building on the scholarly work of  Smith
and Doe (2018), our research echoes their
findings of a positive relationship between
solar  energy  adoption  and  consumer
spending  patterns.  It  seems that  as  the
sun shines down on Rwanda, so does the
allure  of  budget-friendly  treasures,
drawing  consumers  to  seek  out  dollar
store  wonders  like  moths  to  a  solar-
powered  flame.  Similarly,  the
observations  by  Jones  et  al.  (2019)
resonate with our results, suggesting that
the integration of solar power can indeed
influence  consumer  behavior  in
unsuspected  ways  –  perhaps  inspiring
individuals  to  bask  in  the  glow  of
sustainable energy and then go on a quest
for super-cheap snacks.
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Our  study  transcends  the  traditional
scholarly  landscape  by  embracing
unconventional  sources,  such  as  the
fictional narratives "Solar Flare" and "The
Dollar  Store  Diaries",  to  explore  the
symbolic  resonance of  our  findings  with
the  human  experience.  The  connection
between  solar  power  and  dime-store
dreams  seems  to  reach  beyond  the
confines of empirical data, tapping into an
undercurrent  of  whimsy  that  adds  a
splash of color to the often serious world
of academic inquiry.

Emerging  from  this  vibrant  tapestry  of
research, our results present a compelling
case  for  recognizing  the  intersection  of
solar power generation and the pursuit of
budget  bargains  as  a  bona  fide  area  of
scholarly  inquiry.  As  we  peer  into  the
dazzling scatterplot, it's as if we can see
the  faint  yet  unmistakable  outline  of  a
shopping  cart,  filled  to  the  brim  with
solar-powered solutions  and  dollar  store
delights.  This  unexpected  correlation,
while  ripe  with  amusing  overtones,
carries  important  implications  for
understanding  the  complex  interplay
between sustainable energy adoption and
consumer behavior.

In  conclusion,  our  study  not  only
broadens  the  scope  of  scholarly
investigation  into  renewable  energy
impacts  but  also  invites  a  playful
reimagining  of  the  ways  in  which  solar
power  may  weave  into  the  fabric  of
everyday  consumer  choices.  The  solar-
powered siren call of dollar store bargains
beckons,  and  our  research  offers  a
glimmer of insight into this curious dance
between light, energy, and the pursuit of
an irresistible deal.

CONCLUSION

In conclusion, our research has not only
shed light on the unexpected correlation
between  solar  power  generation  in
Rwanda and the fervent quest for budget
bargains  at  dollar  stores  but  has  also
added  a  ray  of  sunshine  to  the  often-
serious world of scholarly investigations.

It appears that as Rwanda's solar power
generation  has  risen,  so  too  has  the
interest in hunting down discounted deals
– perhaps indicating that after trimming
their utility bills, folks are eager to hunt
for some dollar store thrills. Like a solar-
powered  garden  light,  our  findings
illuminate  an  unusual  path  that  merits
further exploration.

With a correlation coefficient as high as a
rooftop  solar  panel  and  a  p-value  lower
than the price of most items at a dollar
store, it's clear that this connection is as
strong  as  a  sturdy  discount-store
shopping  cart.  The  r-squared  value
further  corroborates  the  tight
relationship,  suggesting  that  the
fluctuation  in  "dollar  store  near  me"
searches  is  as  predictable  as  a  Dollar
Store  restocking  their  shelves  with
assorted goods.

As  we close  the  pages  of  this  eyebrow-
raising chapter in the annals of research,
it is obvious that the correlation between
solar  power in  Rwanda and dollar  store
searches is about as real as finding a 24-
carat  diamond  in  the  toy  section  of  a
dollar  store.  Therefore,  we  confidently
assert that no further research is needed
in  this  area.  It's  as  settled  as  a  dollar
store's  inventory  –  and  if  you  find
something at the dollar store, you can be
assured that it's a bargain!
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