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Abstract

This paper explores the peculiar relationship between the cumulative goals scored by Vincent Kompany 
in domestic matches and the frequency of Google searches for 'skydiving accident'. Using a combination 
of data from Wikipedia and Google Trends, we set out to investigate whether there is a statistical 
connection between the two seemingly unrelated phenomena. Our findings revealed a statistically 
significant correlation coefficient of 0.5054666 and p < 0.05 over the period of 2004 to 2020, suggesting 
that as the goals piled up for Kompany, so did the curiosity about skydiving accidents. We propose some 
comically quirky theories to explain this unexpected correlation and delve into potential implications for 
both the realms of sports and internet searches. This research not only adds a touch of humor to the often
serious field of statistics but also offers a unique perspective on the interplay between sports 
achievements and public interest in unconventional activities.
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1. Introduction

INTRODUCTION

     "Striking in the Sky: The Kompany of
Goals and the Free Fall of Curiosity" sounds
like the title  of  a  quirky movie  featuring  a
skydiving soccer player with a penchant for
puns. Alas, it is not a work of fiction, but the
title  of  our  delightfully  peculiar  research
endeavor.  We  set  out  on  this  whimsical
journey  to  investigate  the  perplexing
relationship  between  the  cumulative  goals
scored  by  Vincent  Kompany  in  domestic

matches  and  the  frequency  of  Google
searches  for  'skydiving  accident'.  If  you're
scratching your head in bewilderment, fear
not;  you're  not  alone  in  pondering  the
potential  connection between a footballer's
strikes and the unfortunate flukes of  thrill-
seeking adventurers. 

     Picture this: a 6'4" Belgian, clad in his
team's  colors,  gracefully  maneuvering  the
field  to  score  goals,  while  thousands  of
miles  away,  internet  users  are  furiously
typing 'skydiving accident' into their search
bars. At first glance, one might assume this

This paper is AI-generated, but the correlation and p-value are real.  More info: tylervigen.com/spurious-research



correlation  to  be  as  unlikely  as  scoring  a
goal  from  the  halfway  line  –  a  rare
spectacle,  yet  not  entirely  impossible.
However,  the  statistical  enigma  that  we
uncovered suggests otherwise.

    You might  be wondering how this odd
association came to be. Well, it  all  started
with a dash of curiosity, a pinch of humor,
and  a  dollop  of  statistical  analysis.  We
embarked on this journey armed with data
from Wikipedia and Google Trends,  and a
spirit  of  adventure  akin  to  a  high-stakes
skydive. What emerged from this seemingly
whimsical pursuit is a statistically significant
correlation coefficient of 0.5054666 and p <
0.05 over the period of 2004 to 2020. The
plot  thickens,  doesn't  it?  For  every  goal
scored by Kompany, there appears to be a
corresponding  surge  in  curiosity  about
skydiving accidents. It seems that his strikes
on the field have elicited an unexpected free
fall of interest in gravity-defying mishaps.

    It is our hope that this research will not
only entertain but also provoke a chuckle or
two,  bringing  a  lighthearted  touch  to  the
oftentimes  stoic  domain  of  statistical
analysis.  Who  knew  that  delving  into  the
world of sports and internet searches could
yield such whimsical results? In the pages
that  follow, we aim to unfold the layers of
this  curious correlation,  sprinkling in  some
comically  quirky  theories  and speculations
along the way. So, fasten your seatbelts (or
should we say parachute harnesses?),  for
we are about to take you on a rollercoaster
ride through the Kompany of goals and the
free fall of curiosity!

2. Literature Review

In our pursuit of uncovering the perplexing
relationship  between  the  cumulative  goals
scored  by  Vincent  Kompany  in  domestic
matches  and  the  frequency  of  Google
searches for 'skydiving accident', we delved
into existing literature from both the realms
of  sports  and  internet  curiosities.  Smith

(2012)  asserts  the  significance  of  goal-
scoring  patterns  in  influencing  audience
engagement  and  draws  attention  to  the
potential  ripple  effects  on diverse fields  of
interest. Meanwhile, Doe and Jones (2016)
examine  the  influence  of  unconventional
sports  figures  on  public  fascination  and
draw parallels to the potential ripple effects
of  such  phenomena  on  internet  search
behavior.

However,  as  we  ventured deeper  into  the
research  landscape,  we  stumbled  upon  a
treasure  trove of  unexpected  sources that
added a touch of whimsy to our exploration.
In "Hang Time: A Journey into the World of
Aerial  Thrills,"  aviation  enthusiast  Amelia
Earhart  hilariously  posits  a  connection
between  soaring  goals  on  the  field  and
soaring  dreams  in  the  sky,  offering  a
lighthearted  perspective  on  the  correlation
between  athletic  achievements  and
adventurous  pursuits.  On  the  other  hand,
"Falling  for  Goals:  The  Skydiving
Chronicles"  by  D.B.  Cooper,  an  enigmatic
author  who  seems  to  have  vanished  into
thin air, takes a more mysterious approach
that  leaves  readers  pondering  the
connection  between  sports  prowess  and
aerial escapades.

While  these  fictional  accounts  may  seem
far-fetched,  they  underscore  the  curiosity
and  speculation  surrounding  our  research
question. Moreover, the whimsical world of
board  games  also  provided  peculiar
inspiration.  The  game  "Goal  Diver:  The
Quest  for  Skydiving  Success"  features  an
unconventional protagonist who attempts to
score  goals  in  mid-air  while  skydiving,
blending the realms of sports and airborne
adventures  in  a  comically  quirky  manner.
This  unexpected  association  between
sports  and  skydiving  further  piqued  our
interest  and  humorously  underscored  the
potential interplay between the two realms.

As we transition from the serious to the silly
in our exploration of literature, it is evident
that our research question has sparked not
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only  academic  curiosity  but  also  a  playful
sense of wonder. The unexpected blend of
books,  games,  and  scholarly  works  all
convey  the  delightful  and  lighthearted
nature  of  our  endeavor  as  we  seek  to
unravel  the  enigmatic  correlation  between
Vincent Kompany's goals and the intrigue of
skydiving accidents.

3. Our approach & methods

METHODOLOGY

To  unravel  the  riddle  of  the  seemingly
whimsical interplay between the cumulative
goals  scored  by  Vincent  Kompany  in
domestic  matches  and  the  frequency  of
Google searches for 'skydiving accident', we
employed a combination of  data collection
and statistical  analysis methods that  could
make  even  the  most  serious  researcher
crack a smile.

Data Collection:

Our  intrepid  research  team  scoured  the
depths  of  the  internet,  delving  into
databases, articles, and various repositories
while  occasionally  navigating  through  the
intricate  labyrinth  of  cat  memes  and  viral
trends. Although we proudly navigated this
digital ecosystem, one must admit that our
primary  sources  were  the  venerable
Wikipedia  and  the  colorful  tapestry  of
human  curiosity  that  is  Google  Trends.
From  the  year  2004  to  2020,  we
meticulously  gathered  data  on  both  the
goals  scored  by  the  towering  figure  of
Vincent  Kompany  and  the  fluctuations  in
internet  users'  desire  to  learn  about
skydiving accidents.

Statistical Analysis:

We  unleashed  the  power  of  statistical
analysis  tools  with  the  same  gusto  as  a
goalkeeper facing a penalty shot, albeit with
fewer  mind  games.  Armed  with  sparkling
spreadsheets and a dexterous command of
statistical  software,  our  team  set  out  to

quantify  the  relationship  -  or  perhaps  the
flight path - between Kompany's goals and
the  soaring  interest  in  skydiving  mishaps.
Through  a  combination  of  correlation
analysis  and  time  series  modeling,  we
sought to uncover patterns and connections
that  could  potentially  shed  light  on  this
inexplicably comical correlation.

Correlation Coefficient Calculation:

With the skill of a goal-scoring maestro, we
calculated  the  correlation  coefficient
between  the  cumulative  goals  scored  by
Vincent Kompany and the volume of Google
searches  for  'skydiving  accident'.  Utilizing
the  Pearson  correlation  coefficient,  we
quantified the strength and direction of the
relationship  between  these  seemingly
divergent  phenomena.  The  resulting
correlation  coefficient  of  0.5054666 left  us
as pleasantly surprised as finding a golden
ticket  in  a  chocolate  bar,  indicating  a
moderate positive correlation with p < 0.05.

Artifact Testing:

In our quest for truth and statistical whimsy,
we  diligently  examined  our  data  for  any
artifacts  or  anomalies  that  could  have
caused this unexpected correlation. Just as
an astute referee scrutinizes each play for
fouls,  we meticulously scrutinized our data
for any spurious signals or peculiar events
that could have inflated our correlation with
the intensity of a VAR review.

While  our  methods  may  have  seemed as
whimsical  as  a  professional  juggler  trying
their hand at statistical analysis, we assure
you  that  our  approach  was  rigorous,
deliberate, and, one might say, Allegri-cal in
its execution. In the following sections, we
will unveil the comically quirky theories and
speculations  that  emerged  from  our
exploration, offering a lighthearted take on
the  underlying  mechanisms  behind  this
fascinating  correlation.  So,  hold  onto  your
seats (and maybe your parachutes), for the
mind-bending journey through the realm of
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the "Striking in the Sky" correlation is about
to take flight!

4. Results

The  results  of  our  investigation  into  the
relationship  between  Vincent  Kompany's
cumulative goals in domestic matches and
Google searches for 'skydiving accident' left
us  both  bewildered  and  amused.  The
statistical  analysis  revealed  a  correlation
coefficient  of  0.5054666,  an  r-squared  of
0.2554964,  and  a  p-value  less  than  0.05
over the period of 2004 to 2020. In simpler
terms,  there's  a  surprisingly  strong
connection  between  the  number  of  goals
Kompany  scored  and  the  frequency  of
people frantically Googling about skydiving
mishaps.

To visually convey this amusing correlation,
we  present  a  scatterplot  (Fig.  1)  that
captures the curious dance between the two
variables. As Kompany's goals climb on the
y-axis,  so  does  the  interest  in  skydiving
accidents  on  the  x-axis,  resulting  in  a
compellingly  upward-trending  scatterplot
that  would  make  any  skydiver  proud.  It
seems that as the goals soared, so did the
public's intrigue in plummeting from the sky
– a truly unexpected juxtaposition.

These  findings  not  only  provide  statistical
evidence for the offbeat connection between
sports  and  outlandish  internet  queries  but
also  invite  a  chuckle  or  two  at  the  sheer
unpredictability  of  it  all.  We can't  help  but
marvel at the quirkiness of the human mind,
which  somehow  led  to  the  peculiar
association between a footballer's prowess
and the curiosity about aerial calamities.

Figure 1. Scatterplot of the variables by year

In the subsequent sections, we'll unravel the
potential  implications  and delve into some
comically  quirky  theories  to  shed  light  on
this unexpected correlation. So, fasten your
seatbelts  (or  should  we  say  parachute
harnesses?), as we embark on a whimsical
journey through the perplexing Kompany of
goals and the free fall of curiosity!

5. Discussion

The  findings  of  our  study  have  certainly
raised more eyebrows than expected,  and
not just because of the skydiving accidents.
Our results supported the prior research in a
remarkably  unexpected  way.  Smith  (2012)
and  Doe  and  Jones  (2016)  stressed  the
influence of athletic achievements on public
interest  and  internet  search  behavior,  and
our study bolstered this notion in a way that
left us all scratching our heads, much like a
confused  goalkeeper  after  conceding  a
bizarre goal.

The  statistically  significant  correlation
between  Vincent  Kompany's  goal-scoring
prowess and the surge in Google searches
for 'skydiving accident' highlights an unlikely
connection  between  athletic
accomplishments and public curiosity about
potentially  perilous  adventures.  This
correlation,  with  a  solid  p-value  less  than
0.05,  reaffirms  the  potentially  profound
impact  of  sports  achievements  on  the
broader  spheres  of  human  interest  and
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illustrates  the  whimsical  unpredictability  of
statistical  analyses,  akin  to  the
unpredictability of an unexpected own goal.

Our visually compelling scatterplot  (Fig.  1)
graphically  encapsulated  the  seemingly
absurd  yet  statistically  meaningful
association between Kompany's goals and
the public's interest in skydiving mishaps. If
there  was  ever  a  time  to  exclaim  "Go
figure!" at a statistical outcome, this would
be it,  much like a striker finding the net in
the closing moments of a game.

Delving  deeper  into  the  comically  quirky
theories  to  explain  this  correlation,  it
becomes  evident  that  this  unexpected
interplay  between  sports  triumph  and
interest in skydiving accidents embodies the
capricious  nature  of  human  curiosity.
Whether it's the thrill of witnessing an aerial
spectacle  on  the  field  or  the  intrigue  of
potential  airborne  calamities,  our  findings
provide  an  unexpected  but  fascinating
glimpse  into  the  charmingly  idiosyncratic
black box of human behavior, much like the
enigmatic  disappearance  of  D.B.  Cooper
but with a statistically significant twist.

So,  while  our  study might  not  unravel  the
enigma of  skydiving  accidents,  it  certainly
adds  a  splash  of  light-heartedness  to  the
often stoic field of statistical research. The
whimsical journey through the Kompany of
goals and the free fall of curiosity has left us
with  a  heightened  appreciation  for  the
unpredictably  delightful  and  sometimes
preposterous twists that statistical analyses
can unveil. In the spirit of our findings, we'll
leave you with a final pun: it seems that in
the realm of statistics, chance plays a sky-
high role in uncovering the most unexpected
connections.

6. Conclusion

In  conclusion,  our  peculiar  expedition  into
the correlation between Vincent Kompany's
goals  and  Google  searches  for  'skydiving

accident'  has  left  us  with  a  newfound
appreciation  for  the  whimsical  nature  of
statistical analysis. Who would have thought
that the soaring strikes of a footballer could
ignite  such  a  fervent  interest  in  skydiving
mishaps?  It's  as  though  Kompany's  goals
have  become the  catalyst  for  a  skydiving
curiosity free fall.

Through our comically quirky journey, we've
not only uncovered a statistically significant
correlation coefficient but also embarked on
a  heartwarming  adventure  through  the
uncharted territories of  sports and internet
searches.  The  scatterplot  depicting  the
dance  between  Kompany's  goals  and  the
fascination  with  skydiving  accidents  is  a
sight  to  behold,  evoking  a  peculiar
juxtaposition that would make any skydiver
proud.

As  we reflect  on  our  findings,  it's  evident
that  this  correlation  embodies  the
unexpected twists and turns that make life
and  statistical  analysis  so  delightfully
unpredictable.  Our  research  has  not  only
added a touch of humor to the often serious
realm of statistics but has also enlivened the
otherwise conventional relationship between
sports achievements and public curiosity.

With a twinkle in our eyes and a chuckle in
our hearts, we assert that no further inquiry
is needed in this delightfully eccentric realm.
Our  work  stands  as  a  testament  to  the
captivating  interplay  between  seemingly
unrelated  phenomena,  leaving  us  with  a
newfound  appreciation  for  both  statistical
oddities and the whimsy of human curiosity.
Let us savor this peculiar harmony between
the Kompany of  goals  and the free fall  of
curiosity,  for  it  is  a  testament  to  the
delightful  unpredictability  of  the  human
psyche.
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